DeWight Dopslauf, C.P.M., CPPO
Harris County Purchasing Agent

April 20, 2021

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE:  Job No. 200354

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of lowest and best bid by item and/or group:

Description:

Uniforms and Related Item for Harris County Constable Precinct 5

Quotes Received:  Four (4) on December 14, 2021 (see attached)

Term: May 1, 2021 through April 30, 2022 with four (4) one — year renewal options
Vendors: C & G Police Supply dba
C & G Wholesale Group I Items A-V, X-CC, FF, Groups II-TV $435,777
Galls, LLC Group I Items W, DD and EE 73.855
$509,632
Amount: $509,632
Reviewed by: X _Constable Precinct 5 X _Harris County Purchasing

Purchase orders will be issued as required upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

DeWight Dopsla{ﬁ"
Purchasing Agent
MIS/
Attachment
cc: Constable Precinct 5
Vendors

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA APRIL 27, 2021

1001 Preston, Suite 670, Houston, TX 77002 Tel 713-274-4400 Fax 713-755-6695
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Bid Tabulation far Job 200354 - Uniforms and Related Itema for Harris County Constable Precinct 5

Fernander Investoent Group Inc dba Cop Stop? c& upply dba C & G Whall = !
T . G Police § egale ‘Wiebb Uniforms Galls LLC
No. Messare | Quantitles Maunfacturer Stock Namber | Unit Price | Total Price Manufacturer Siock Namber Unit Price Tatal Price zr | SteckNunaber | Unii Price | Total Priec | Maoufacturer| Steck Number | Unkt Price Total Price
Group I Uniform Garments

A |Trousers, Men's Cargo Hidden Pocket

ajsize 28-38 £ 130 Splewak SUI0 45,50 §.825.00 | Flying Cross FX FX67400 5500 8,250.00 Biawer BE6E —5F2F | — 56750 Blaer 2656 DKNV 65.00 9,900.00

bl size 40 -52 €2 250 Spiewak SU320 45.50 1137500 |  Flying Cross FX FX67400 8.00 14,500.0¢ Bitter 8666 —F2F | — 3RS0 Blauer 265T DKNV 66.00 16,500.00
B |Troosers, Women's Cargo Hidden Pocket

a|size 2-16 ea 150 Spiewak SUR0WMN 4550 5,825.00 | Flying Cross FX. FX67400% 3500 8,250.00 Blauer BEEEH —5F25 | —B55 50 Blaser BGS6W DKNY 66.00 9.900.00

b|size [8-26 €1 250 Spicwak SU320WMN 45.5¢ 11,375.00 | Flyiog Cross FX. FX67400W 5800 14,500.00 Blaucs BBV —5F35 | —H431250 Blaver B6S6W DENYV 65.00 16,500.00
C |Trousers, Men's Cargo Pockel]

a|size 28-38 <8 150 Spiewak SU321 45.50 6382500 | Flying Cross FX FX67300 5500 8,250.00 Blawer 8665 —S5s | — 831750 Blauer 8665 5300 9,450.00

b|size 40 -52 =1 250 Spiewak SURL 45.50 11,375,00 |  Flying Cross FX FX67300 58.00 14,500,04 Bloser 2665 —56d8 | —— 1336250 Blauer 8465 63.00 15,750.00
B |Trousers, Women's Cargo Pocket

a|size 28-38 28 Spiewak SUIZIWMN 45.50 1274.00 | Flying Cross FX FX6TI00W 5500 1,540.00 Plover B6E5VE ——5545 | b 55080 Blaoer B555W DRNY 63.00 1,764.00

bsize 40 -52 10 Spicwak SUIZIWMN 45.50 455.00 |  Flyg Cross FX FX62300W S8.00 580.00 Bleuer 2L ~——55AE | —— 55450 Bleoer 8665W DRNV 6300 630.00
E |Troasers, Men's Poly/Wool Blend

a|sire 28-38 80 Flying Cross 47280 64.00 5,120.00 | Flying Croes PW 47280 61.00 4,880.00 | Fechheimer 47280 64.75 5,180.00 | Fechheimer 47280 T72.00 5,760.00

b|size 40 .52 ca 156 Flyieg Cross 47280 44,00 9,984.00 | Flying Cross PW 47280 6100 4.516.00 |  Fechhrimey 47280 7475 1166100 § Fechheimer 47280 7200 11232.00
F |Trousers, Women's Poly/Wool Blend

alsize 2-16 ea 37 Flying Cross 4T2R0W 64.00 2268.00 { Flying Cross PW 47280W 81.00 2257.00 | Fechheimer 47290 6475 239575 | Fechheimer 47290 72,00 2,664.00

bsize 18-26 ea 8 Flying Cross 47280W 64,00 51200 | Flying Crocs FW 47280W 81.00 488.00 | Fachheimer 47230 IS 598,00 | Fechheimer 47220 TLO0 576.00
G |Shirt, Shert Sleeve, Men's

alsize SM-XL [} 250 Spiewak Su3tozs 41.00 10,25¢.040 |  Flying Croes FX FX6100 55.00 13,750.00 Blaver BEF6 ——5h40 | 35000 Blsuer 8678 DENY &2.00 15,500.00

bisize XXL-4XL [ 90 Spiewak Su310ZS 45.00 4,050.00 | Flying Cross FX. EX5100 59.00 5§310.00 Blauer 656 ——H | ——hF2500 Blauer 3676 DKNV §2.00 5,580.00
H |Shirt, Short Sleeve Class B, Men's

a|size SM- XL ea 250 Spiewak Suslozs 45.00 1125000 |  Flying Cross FX FX6100 £5.00 16.230.00 Blader 2676 ——53 | —33 60000 Blausr 8676 DENV 89,00 22,250.00

bsize XML~ 4XL ea 90 Spicwak SU310Z8 49,00 441000 | Flying Crosa FX FX5100 §9.00 6210.00 Blaver BET6 —d0 | —— 30500 Blaner 8676 DENV 82.00 8,01¢.60
I |Shirvt, Short Sleeve, Women's

a|size 28-40 ca 70 Spicwak suanzs 41.00 2,870.00 | Flying Cross FX FX6100W 55.00 385080 Blauer 8§35V —548 | — 250800 Blauer 86T6W BENV 62.00 424000

b|size 42-50 ea 30 Spiewak SUINzs 45.00 1,350.0¢ | Flying Cross FX FX810W 59.00 1,TH80 Blauer 8EI6W —548 | — 54208 Blaver 86T6W DKNV 62,00 1,360.00
J |Shirt, Short Sleeve Class B, Women's

a[size 28-40 ea 70 Spicwak SU31128 45.00 315000 | Flying Cross FX FX6100W 65.00 4,550,00 Bleer BV 540 | —— 355800 Blauer BETEW 85,00 6,230.00

b size 42-50 ez 30 Spiewak SUL1ZS 49,50 148500 |  Flying Cross FX FX6100W 68.00 2,070.00 Bianpr BEIOW —5540 | —1 200 Blaver BETEW 85.00 2,670.00
K |Shirt, Short Sleeve Poly/Wool Blend , Men'

a] sizes 14- 16.5 ea 240 Fiying Cross STRBAZ 57.00 13,680.00 | Flying Croea FW STRE4Z 5300 12,720.00 | Fechbeimer STRETRSZ 5140 12336.00 | Fechheimer STRB7B6Z 61.00 16,050.00

by sizes 17-13.5 2 255 Flying Croes STR84Z 57.00 14,535.00 | Flyiog Cross PW STRMZ 53.00 13,515.00 | Fechhemmer STRSTBGZ 3140 13,107.00 | Fechheimer STRBTREZ 67.00 17,085.00

¢f sizes 19-22.5 o 37 Flying Cross STRBAZ §1.00 2,109.00 | Flying Croes FW STRMZ 53.00 1,961.00 |  Fechheimer STREI86Z 5140 1,901.80 | Fochheimer STRBTE6Z 62.00 2479.00
L |Shirt, Short Sleeve Poly/Woal Blend Class B, Men's

a| sizes 14- 16.5 L1 120 Flying Croes STRBAZ £5.00 780000 | Flying Cross PW 5TR34Z £3.00 7,560.00 Fechheimer STRETRGZ 62.50 3,100.00 | Feckheimer STRRTESZ, 94.00 11,280.00

b sizes 17- 18.5 L1 150 Flying Cross STREAZ £5.00 9,750.00 | Flying Cross FW STRB4Z. 63.00 9450.00 | Fechheimer STRBYBEZ 7D 11,625.00 | Fechheimer STRBTESZ 94.00 14,100.00

cf sizes 19-22.5 e 20 Flying Cross STRE4Z £5.00 1,300.00 | Flying Cross FW STRIAZ 63.00 1,260.00 § Fechbeimer STRBIBEE 850 1,750.00 | Fechhehnar STRBIEEZ 94.00 1,880.00
™ |Shirt, Short Slecve Poly/Weol Bkud ,Woimnen's

8| sizes 30« 40 [ 32 Flying Cross 57R84 5300 2,756.00 | Flying Cross PW 5TR84 53.00 2,756,00 |  Fechbeimer I57TRE4B6Z 59.50¢ 3,094.00 | Fechheimer 157RS486Z 67.00 3,484.00

b sizes 42- 48 ea 40 Flying Cross STR84 53.00 212000 | Flying Cross FW 5TR&4 53.00 2,120.00 | Fechheimer [5TRE4B4Z. £69.50 2,780.00 | Fechheimer 15TRE486Z 67.00 2,680.00

¢| sizes §0- 52 € 2 Flying Croas 5TR34 53.00 108,00 { Flying Cross PW 5TR34 53.00 106.00 | Fechheimer LSTRRABGZ 79.50 15940 [ Fechheimer 157R84867, 67.00 134.00
N |Shirt, Short Sleeve PolyfWeool Blend Class B, Women's

8| sizes 3¢- 40 -] 30 Flying Cross STRB4 61.00 1,8X00 | Flying Cross FW 3TRE4 83.00 1,890.00 | Fachheimer L5TRB4E6Z 62.50 202500 | Fechheimer 157RBAB6Z 24,00 2,820.00

b sizes 42- 48 ez 20 Flying Cross STRA4 61.00 122000 | Flying Crocs FW 5TR24 63.00 1,260,00 | Fechheimer 15TR8486Z .50 1,550.00 | Fechheimer 157RBAR6Z 84.00 1,880.00

| sizes 50- 52 ea 2 Flying Cross STRS4 61.00 1200 | Flyng Cross PW 57TR#A 63.00 126.00 | Fechheimer 15TRE455Z 82.50 17500 | Fechheimer 15TRE486Z 94,00 188.00
r [Shirt, Long Sleeve , Men's

a|size SM-XL ea 260 Spiewak SU3ISZS 45.00 11,700.00 | Flyig Cross FX FX1620 §5.00 14,300.00 Biauer 857 kS | — TSR Blmer 867IDKNV §7.00 17,420.00

b|size XKL~ 4XL ea 120 Spizwak suU3alszs 5050 6,060.00 |  Flying Cross FX FX6120 59.00 7,080.00 Blaver L —5545 | 585400 Blsuer B4TIDKNV §1.00 8,040,00
P |Shirt, Long Sleeve Class B, Men's

a|size SM- XL ca 160 Spiewak SU3ISZS 43.50 7.920.00 | Flying Cross FX FX1620 4§5.00 10,400.00 Blouer 631 ——63:45 | — 05200 Blager BETIDENYV 94.00 15,040,600

b|size XXL- 4XL ea T0 Spicwak 531528 55.50 3,885.00 | Flying Cross FX FX6120 49,00 4,830.00 Blauer =4 —48 | ——snkR Blager S6TIDKNY 94.00 6,580.00
Q |Shirt, Long Sleeve, Women's

a|size 2840 ea 50 Spicivak SU316Z8 45.00 2,700.00 |  Flyg Croas FX FX1620W 55.00 3,300.00 Blauer BT —s | —3327.00 Blausr 861W 67.00 4,920.00

bsize 42-50 ea 25 Spiewsk 8031628 50.50 1,262.50 |  Flying Croes FX FX1620W 59.00 147500 Blauer B —hds | — 28628 Blaver B6TIW 87,60 1.675.00
R |Shirt, Long Sleeve Clays B, Women's

a|size 2840 ca &0 Spiewnk BU316ZS #9.50 2,570.00 | Flying Croes FX FX1620W 85.00 3.500.00 Bieuer BEIW —k4s | — 230700 Blauer 8671w 94.00 5,640.00

h|size 42-50 ca 25 Spiewak SU316ZS 55.50 138750 ¢ Flying Cross FX FX1620W 69.00 1.725.00 Biates EEHW b3S | — 58425 Blauer SE7IW 94.00 2,350.00
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Bjd Takulatiog for Job 200354 - Uniforms end Relted Ytetna for Harris County Constable Precinct §

= - Fernaudez Investroent Grewp Inc dba Cop Stap” C & G Polke Supply dha C & G Wholesale Webh Unifortm ~* Galls LIC"
af
No. [Description Measure | Quantities Steck Nomber | UnitPiice | Total Price Manufs Stock Number Unit Price Total Price Stock Nexsber | UnitPrice | Tutal Price Stock Namber | Unit Price Tetal Price
S |Shirt, Long Sleeve Poly'Wool Blend, Men's
z| sizes 14+ 16.5 ea 120 Flying Croex DTWEHZ 63.00 756000 | Flying Cross PW OTWELZ 59.00 7.080.00 | Fechheimer OTWRTEEZ 65.50 7.860.00 | Fechheimer TTWEIREZ 200 8,540.00
b sizes §7- 185 ea 150 Flying Cross OTWEAZ 63.00 9450.00 | Flying Crocs PW OTWE4Z 59.00 8,850.00 | Fechheimer 0TWRTI6Z 75.50 11,325.00 | Fechhsimer QTWETREZ .00 10,200.00
c| sizes §9-22.5 - 20 Flying Cross. OTWEIZ 63,00 1260.00 | Flying Cross FW OTWEAZ 59.00 LIR0.00 |  Fechheimer OTWRTIEZ 85.50 1719.00 | Fechheimer OTWEISEZ 150 144000
T |Shirt, Long Sleeve Paly/Wool Blend Class B, Men's
a| sizes [4-16.5 [} 80 Flying Cross OTWEAZ 70.00 5,600.00 | Flying Croes PW OTWEAZ 69,00 552000 § Fechheimer OTWETECZ T3S0 588000 | Fechheimer OTWETSEZ 99.00 7.920.00
b sizes 7- 185 ca 100 Flying Crass QTWHZ T0.00 T,000.00 | Flying Cross PW OTWR4Z §9.00 £,500.00 Fechheimer OTWBTEGE 83.30 8,350.00 | Fechheimer OTWERISEZ 99.00 9,900.00
c| sizes [9-22.5 ea 20 Flying Cross GTWEAZ 70.00 1,400.00 | Flying Croes FW OTWZ 49,00 138000 § Fechheimer O0TWS786Z 50 1,870.00 | Fechheimer OTWETR5Z 92.¢0 1,930.00
U |Shini, Long Sleeve Poly/Wool Blend, Women's
a| sizes 30- 40 [ 30 Flying Cross 107w 59.00 1,770.00 | Flying Cross P 0TW34 59.00 1,77000 | Fechheimer 10TWS786Z £5.50 156500 ] Fechheimer L07TW81B6Z 700 2,160.00
b sizes 42- 48 ca 20 Flying Ceoss 107w 59.00 1,180.00 | Flying Cross FW 0TW34 59.00 1,180.00 | Fechheimer 10TW3786Z 7550 151004 | Fechheimer 107TWSTBEZ 200 144000
| sizes 50- 52 ea 2 Flying Cross 107Wid 59.00 11304 { Flyicg Cross PW 07TW34 59.00 11800 | Fechheimer T0TWB786Z B5.50 17100 | Fechheimer 107WSI85Z 7200 144.00
Y |ShirtLong Sleeve PalyiWool Blend Class B, Women's
8| sizes 30- 40 ea 20 Flying Crass 10TWRd4 67.00 1,340.00 | Flying Cross PW 16784 69.00 1,380.00 | Fechheimer 10TWE485Z .50 1470.00 | Fechheimer 107WB4B6Z 95.00 1,980.00
b sizes 42-48 =] H) Flying Cross 107W34 67.00 &70.00 | Flying Cross PW 10784 6500 6590.00 | Fechheimer 107WB4357, 33.50 83500 | Fechheimer 107TWE4B6Z 83.00 §5%0.00
©| sizes 50- 52 ex 2 Flying Cross T07W34 61.00 13400 | Flyiog Cross PW 10784 8900 13800 | Fechheimer 10TWB4BSZ 93.50 187.00 | Fechhefmer 1OTWB4E6Z 9500 198,00
W [Tacket, convertible
a/5izes small 1o xlarge o 255 Flyiog Croes TILE0A/S4100A 199,00 50,745.00 Na Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid Gerber TIDXVL 15500 43,095.00 Gerber TiDXNL 185.00 47,175.0¢
bt sizes 2xlarge to 4xlarge 0 49 Flying Croes T3L60A/54100A 199.00 9,751.00 NoBid NeBid NeBid No Bid Gerber TIDXVL 179.00 8,771.00 Gerber DXL 185.00 9,063.00
¢|sizes Sxlarge to 6 xlerge 1 4 Flying Cross TILE0A/S4100A 199.00 796.00 No Bid NeBid NoBid Ro Bid Gerber TNDXUL 185.00 756.00 Gerber TDX)L 185.0¢ T40.00
X |Trousers, Men's Tactical Carge
a|size 28-38 e 564 First Tactical 114011 41.50 23,406.00 5.11 Stryke T4369 54.50 30,732.00 511 4369 &0.00 33,840.00 511 4359 38.00 32,712.00
b|size 40 -52 ea 105 Fixst Tactical 114011 4750 4,987.50 5.11 Stryke 74368 6250 6,562.50 LS 74369 60.00 6,300,00 R3] 4369 S3.00 5,090.00
Y |Trousers, Women's Tactical Cargo
a|size 2-16 ea 135 First Tactical 124011 4150 5.602.50 £.11 Stryke 64386 S4.50 735750 511 63386 60.00 8,100,00 &l 64386 58.00 7,830.00
b|size 18-20 ea 20 First Tuctical 124011 41.50 830.00 5.11 Stryke 64386 5450 189009 511 64386 60.00 1260.00 511 64386 52.00 1.160.00
Z |Troasers, Men's Cargo
a|size 28-38 ea 450 No Bid NeBid No Bid No Bid 511 Apex 74434 5350 24075.00 511 74434 50.00 2700000 51 74434 58.00 26,100.00
bsize 40 -52 =1 75 No Bid WoBid No Bid No Bid 5.11 Apex 74434 53.50 4,4112.50 511 74434 60,00 4500.00 il 74434 58.00 4,350.00
AA |Trousers, Women's Cargo
a[size 2-16 ea 10§ No Bid Ne Bid No Bid NoBid 5,11 Apex 64446 53.50 5,617.50 511 446 59.08 6.195.00 5:11 64446 58.00 6,080.00
b|size 18-20 ea 15 NoBid Na Bid No Bid No Bid 5.13 Apex 64346 53.5¢ 802.50 51 64446 55.00 885.00 5.1 84446 58.00 870.00
BB [Dress Coat
size 34-18 ea 10 Flying Cross 34891 27500 2,750.00 Flying Cross 34851 258.00 2,580.00 | Fechbeimer 34891 250,50 2,505.00 | Fechheimer 34391 300.00 3,000,00
3ize 54- 60 ca 20 Flying Cross 34891 315.00 6,300.00 Flying Cross 24891 258.00 5,160.00 | Fechhemer 34891 329.50 6,590.00 | Fechbrimer 34891 300.00 6,000.00
CC |Rafn Coat, Fufl Leagih
a[size Med- X1 e 200 Liberty SBEMEL 10500 21,800.00 RadiansNeese 475RCIBM 82.50 16,500.00 Gerber TOFIL 144.00 28,800.00 Gober T0F31. 150.00 30,000.00
b|size XHL-4XL L1 (1] Libaty SB6MFL 103.00 6,540.00 PadiansMNesse 475RCH3M 86.50 5,190.00 Gerber TOFAIL 144.00 3,640.00 Groaber T0F3L 150.00 2.000.00
DD |Motwrcycle Rain Pants
2|size Med- XL [} 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid Blader BEE5E S0 | —2E5500 Blaner 9825ZDENY 2580 337500
bsiza X0~ 4XL ea 10 NeBid Na Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid Blaner RE2EE —5%02 | —-5939.20 Blauer IB2SZDKNV 2500 225080
EE (Motarcycle Rain Jacket
a|size Med- XL ea 15 NeBid No Bid NoBid No Bid MNo Bid NoBid NeBid NeBid Blasser 95301 ——F55-80 | ——4 48500 Blaver 9970-50DKNY 450.00 8,750.00
b|size XXT-4XI, ea 16 NeBid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid NeBid Biner 9570-2 —ER | —Heee Blager 9970-50DKNY 450,00 #,500.00
FF |Pole Shirt
a[size sm- XL ea 450 No Bid No Bid NoBijd NoBid United Uniform 571 52.00 23,400.00 Blaver L3 —EE0 | —R20:02500 Blawer S160DKNV 8800 39,600.00
b|size XXL- 4XL ea 180 NoBid NoBid Ne Bid No Hid United Uniform 571 58.00 10,540.00 Bleucs BH50 ——64:50 | — 163000 Blauer B160DKNV &3.00 15.840.00
SUBTOTAL GROUF I 379,321.00 422,716.50 523,736.95 §12,010.00
Group I Blcyele Uniforms
A |Pants, Bike
a| sizes small to xlarge ce 7 No Bid NoBid Ne Bid Na Bid Mocean 2150M 7500 525.00 Blaver S S —5050 Mocean 2150M 50.00 630.00
b| sizes Zxlarge 10 3xlarge ] 3 Nao Bid NoBid Ne Bid Ne Bid Mocean 2150M 80.00 240.00 Blauer BE22L $8:95 —2F285 Mocesn 2150M 90,00 270.00
B ;Shorts, Bike
a7 sizes small to xlarge e 11 NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid Horsee $mall HS2744 45.00 495,00 | Horace Small H32244 40,42 444.62 | Homece Small HSXT43 44.00 484.00
bl sizes 2xlarge to Ixizrge @ 4 NoBid NoBid NoBid Ne Bid Horace Small HS2744 42,00 133,00 | Horace Small HS52744 4042 161.68 | Hemce Small HS2744 44.00 176.00
C |Shirty, Bike
4| sizes small to xlarge L3 16 Flying Croas 8SRT0Z 45.00 720.00 Flying Cross ¥SRID 54.00 200.06 | Fechbeimer 85R70862Z 65 1,000.00 | Feckheimer BSRT08627 80.0% 1,280.00
b sizes 2xlarge to 3xlarge [ 4 Flying Cross SIRTOZ 45,00 180.00 Flying Cross 85R70 50.00 200.00 Fechheimer 85RI08627 T2.5 250.00 hhe 3ISRT0B62Z B5.00 340,00
|SUBTOTAL GROUP [ 900.00 2448.00 2.750.65 3,180.00
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Bid Tabulation for Job 200354 - Uniforms and Related It=mg for Huaris County Constab]x Precinct 5

Fernandrz [nvestment Group Tue b Cop Stop™ C & G Police Supply dba C & G Whelesle Webb Ustforms =2 GasLLC!
Tlm_m — Umtof | Esilmated
New Deacription Measure | Quantities Manuls Stack Number | Unit Price | Total Price Muanufactarer Stock Number Unit Price Total Price | N arer | Stock Number]  Unit Price Total Price | Manafacturerf Stuck Number Unlt Price Tots] Price
Group Il Communiestions/Civilian Shirt
A |Polo Shirt, Men's
3| sizes small to xlarge ca 15 First Tactical 112509 3130 502.50 11 T4g 38.00 570.00 51 71049 2.0 630,00 11 710453 46,00 690.00
b sizes 2xlarge to Sxlarge ca 6 First Tactical 12503 3350 201.00 5.1 1049 4100 246.00 5.1 71042 200 252.00 =N 1043 45.00 276.00
B |Polo Shirt, Women's
4| sizes small to 2xlarge ea 40 First Tactical 12509 31.50 134000 EA1 G165 33.00 1,520.00 11 61165 42,00 1,680.00 i 61165 46.00 1,840.00
C |Polo Shirt, Men"s
a| sizes smal? to xlarge ea 8 Comerstone 8410 29.00 23200 Comnerstone C3410 25.00 23200 | Comerstone 4l 30.00 240,00 | Cornemstone T840 45,00 368.00
b sizes Zxlergs o Sxlarge = 3 Comerstone C8410 32.00 9500 Comerstans 38410 300 93.00 | Comerstene 3L 32.00 96,00 | Comemstone T8410 46.00 122.00
D |Palo Shirt, Women's
a| sizes smell to 2xlarge ca 20 Coroerstons cs4n 29.00 580,00 Comerstone C841t 2900 5820.00 | Comerstone c841) 30.00 600.00 | Comerstons 54l 46.00 $20.00
E [Jacket, softshell
a| sizes small to xlarge e 25 Flying Cross S3100A 85.00 2,225.00 Port Autherity  |1317mens/L3 7 i) 40.00 1,000.00 Gerber 5181 95.00 237500 Gerber 5181 95.00 237500
b| sizes 2xlarge to 4xlarge [ 15 Flying Cross S5100A 85.00 1,335.00 |  Port Authority  [J217me/1.317 ladies 46.00 630.00 Gezber 5151 105.0¢ 1575.00 Gurber 5181 5,00 1.425.00
SUBTOTAL GROUP IE 6,511.50 4931.00 T448.00 £.032.00
Growp IV Accessorcs
A Necktie Cl 30 Semuel Broome | $0010/50043/500053 600 30000 | Samusl Broome 2001061 199 199.50 | Sam Broome $0010-61 4.00 200.0¢ | SumBroome $0010-61 600 300.00
B |Logo Patch- Shoulder ca 4,500 Hero's Pride Custom L30 5,850.00 Custom. Shonlder 0.93 418540 { Hero's Pride X 199 895500 100 4,500.00
C |Communication ACivilizn Patch ca 40 Hero's Pride Costom 35 15440 Custom mini 0.5% 3%.60 | Hero's Pride X 215 86.00 085 3800
D |Sergeant Patch ] 250 Hero's Pride Custom 225 56250 Custam =g 14% 37250 | Hero'sPride X 215 53750 LIS 287.50
E |Corporal Patch ca &0 Hero's Pride Custom 3% 234.00 Custom cap 149 89.40 | Hero's Pride X 210 126.00 150 SO0
F |Years of Service Hash Marks 23 350 Hero's Pride Custom 1.5¢ 75.00 Castom. hath 125 6250 | Hero's Pride X 050 45.00 0.95 A150
G [Brdge Patches
a[gold €1 160 Hexo's Pride Custem 2.25 360.00 Castom Glod .59 15840 | Hew's Pride .9 200 320.00 050 144.00
b|silver [ 3 300 Hero's Pride Custem 195 975.00 Custom. Silver .99 49500 | Hero's Pride X 200 1,000.00 050 450,00
¢|gold with silver i 80 Hero's Pride Costem: 285 228.00 Custom. 2-lone .99 7920 | Hero's Pride X 200 160.00 0.5¢ 200
SUBTOTAL GROUP IV 8,738.90 5.681.10 11,429.50 5,929.00
GRAND TOTAL 3 30548140 3 435,7176.60 $ 545 3‘!5.10 3 62%,15).00

! Awerd Reconunendation Lowest and Best Bid ( € & G Police Supply dba C & G Wholesale Groap L Iwns A-V, X-CC, FF, Groups LIV and Galls Groap L Items W, DI end EE)
? Carrected Total
" Withddrew ltems Group I A-D, G-I ; O-R sod DD-FF,
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