



**DeWight Dopslauf, C.P.M., CPPO
Harris County Purchasing Agent**

March 16, 2021

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE: Job No. 200357

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of lowest most complete bid:

Description: Food Service Products and Related Items for Harris County
Bid(s) Received: Two (2) on December 21, 2020 (see attached)
Vendor(s): Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Term: April 01, 2021 – March 31, 2022 with four (4) one-year renewal options
Amount: \$357,904
Evaluated By:

- Harris County Purchasing
- Precincts 1-4
- Sheriff's Office
- Toll Road Authority
- Juvenile Probation

Item 1j will not be awarded. Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

DeWight Dopslauf
Purchasing Agent

Attachment(s)
cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA MARCH 30, 2021

Interboro Packaging										Sam Tell and Son, Inc. ¹				
Item No.	Description	Unit of Measure	Manufacturer (if not bidding referenced items)	Model# (if not bidding referenced items)	Qty. Per Box or Case and Price Per Single Item	Est. Quantity	Unit Price (E)	Total Price (E x F)	Manufacturer (if not bidding referenced items)	Model# (if not bidding referenced items)	Qty. Per Box or Case and Price Per Single Item	Est. Quantity	Unit Price (E)	Total Price (E x F)
1	GLOVES													
	a Clear poly glove - large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	10,000	1	\$ 48.00	\$ 48.00				1	\$ 61.56	\$ 61.56
	b Clear poly glove - extra large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	10,000	2	\$ 48.00	\$ 96.00				2	\$ 61.56	\$ 123.12
	c Vinyl, med grade exam glove - small	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	10	\$ 98.00	\$ 980.00	Safety Zone	GVPS-SM-1	1,000	10	\$ 94.22	\$ 942.20
	d Vinyl, med grade exam glove - medium	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	80	\$ 98.00	\$ 7,840.00	Safety Zone	GVPS-MD-1	1,000	80	\$ 94.22	\$ 7,537.60
	e Vinyl, med grade exam glove - large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	900	\$ 98.00	\$ 88,200.00	Safety Zone	GVPS-LG-1	1,000	900	\$ 94.22	\$ 84,798.00
	f Vinyl, med grade exam glove - extra large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	10	\$ 98.00	\$ 980.00	Safety Zone	GVPS-XL-1	1,000	10	\$ 94.22	\$ 942.20
	g Latex, powder free, large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	200	\$ 124.00	\$ 24,800.00	Safety Zone	GRPR-LG-1-T	1,000	200	\$ 117.15	\$ 23,430.00
	h Latex, powder free, extra large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	500	\$ 124.00	\$ 62,000.00	Safety Zone	GRPR-XL-1-T	1,000	500	\$ 117.15	\$ 58,575.00
	i Mitts, oven (two (2) pair)	pr				10	\$ -	\$ -	Stanton Trading	9946L	pair	10	\$ 7.18	\$ 71.80
	j Nitrile, white powder free glove, small	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	20	\$ 348.00	\$ 6,960.00	no bid	No Bid	No Bid	20	No Bid	No Bid
	k Nitrile, white powder free glove, medium	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	20	\$ 348.00	\$ 6,960.00	Sam Tell REDE	WNGM	1,000	20	\$ 143.75	\$ 2,875.00
	l Nitrile, white powder free glove, large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	10	\$ 348.00	\$ 3,480.00	Sam Tell REDE	WNGM	1,000	10	\$ 162.50	\$ 1,625.00
	m Nitrile, white powder free glove, extra large	cs	Spring-fill	JobGuard-Lrg-PG	1,000/case	10	\$ 348.00	\$ 3,480.00	no bid			10	\$ -	\$ -
	n 15" Neoprene glove, black, medium	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	San Janar	238F-M	pair	10	\$ 9.01	\$ 90.10
	o 15" Neoprene glove, black, large	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	San Janar	238F-L	pair	10	\$ 9.01	\$ 90.10
p 15" Neoprene glove, black, extra large	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	Impact Products	8333XL	dozen	10	\$ 79.62	\$ 796.20	
2	FOIL (Aluminum)							\$ 205,924.00						\$ 181,957.88
	18" x 1000' roll (heavy duty)	roll	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25	No Bid	No Bid				25	\$ 37.21	\$ 930.25
3	Foil container with lid	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	125	No Bid	No Bid	Handi Foil	2045-35-250W		125	\$ 96.58	\$ 12,072.50
	WRAPS/BAGS (Polyethylene)							\$ -						\$ 13,002.75
4	18" x 2000' wrap	roll	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	Sam Tell & Son	ST18X2F	1 roll	10	\$ 15.79	\$ 157.90
	18" x 1500' wrap	roll	Mfr: IBS	INT-SFI1815-X-Hvy	price per roll	5	\$ 15.82	\$ 79.10	Sam Tell & Son	SHRINKWRAP	1 roll	5	\$ 18.94	\$ 94.70
	sandwich bag, 6 1/2" x 8"	cs	Mfr: IBS/Capital	Elaz# PBZ659	2,000	10	\$ 17.34	\$ 173.40	Bagecraft	300,100	2,000	10	\$ 40.42	\$ 404.20
	10" x 14" snap off bags	cs	Mfr: IBS/Capital	INT-1014-Med	1,000*	5	\$ 8.74	\$ 43.70		PABAGSNAP1014	1,000	5	\$ 29.03	\$ 145.15
	18" x 24" snap off bags	cs	Mfr: IBS/Capital	INT-1824-Hvy	250*	5	\$ 8.82	\$ 44.10		PABAGSNAP1824	250	5	\$ 30.89	\$ 154.45
5	UTENSILS (Plastic, White)							\$ 340.30						\$ 956.40
	Medium weight, polypropylene	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid	No Bid	Sam Tell REDE	SSPPWP1000	1,000	1	\$ 15.45	\$ 15.45
	i Spoons	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20	No Bid	No Bid	Sam Tell REDE	ASSHWPSW1000	1,000	20	\$ 33.00	\$ 660.00
	ii Forks	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	Sam Tell REDE	AFHWPSW1000	1,000	10	\$ 33.00	\$ 330.00
	iii Knives	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	Sam Tell REDE	AKNHVPSB1000	1,000	10	\$ 33.00	\$ 330.00
Subtotal of Item 4														
\$ -														

Sam Tell and Son, Inc. ¹														
Interboro Packaging														
Item No.	Description	Unit of Measure (A)	Manufacturer (if not bidding referenced items) (B)	Model# (if not bidding referenced items) (C)	Qty. Per Box or Case and Price Per Single Item (D)	Est. Quantity (E)	Unit Price (F)	Total Price (E x F)	Manufacturer (if not bidding referenced items) (B)	Model# (if not bidding referenced items) (C)	Qty. Per Box or Case and Price Per Single Item (D)	Est. Quantity (E)	Unit Price (F)	Total Price (E x F)
5	CUPS	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10	No Bid	No Bid	Cempak	W450F	2,500	10	\$	1,296.00
6	PLATES, BOWLS, & TRAYS	cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	20	No Bid	No Bid	Dart Container	376HW-2050	1,000	20	\$	4,513.80
7	MISCELLANEOUS	bd	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	45	No Bid	No Bid	Impact Products	MB-28-500	500	45	\$	5,040.90
Grand Total - Items No. 1 - 7												\$	6,544.24	
Grand Total - Items No. 1 - 7												\$	357,903.57	

¹ Award Recommendation Lowest Most Complete Bid (Item i) will not be awarded)