
February 16, 2024

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE:    Job No. 240006

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of only bid:

Description: Safety Footwear and Related Items for Harris County

Bid(s) Received: One (1) on January 29, 2024 (see attached)

Vendor(s): Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.

Term: February 27, 2024 - January 31, 2025 with four (4) one-year renewal options

Amount: $52,031

Evaluated By: • Harris County Purchasing • Office of the County Engineer

Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

DeWight Dopslauf
Purchasing Agent

PL
cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA FEBRUARY 27, 2024



Job No.  240006 Safety Footwear and Related Items for Harris County

Item No. Description Unit

of

Measure

Estimated

Quantity

Brand

Name

Part

No.

Unit

Price

Total

Price

1. Men's Safety Toe Footwear

#1-1 Men's 9-inch waterproof insulated safety toe leather boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard protection and non-metallic

safety toe; slip, oil, heat, and chemical resistant; 400g

insulation; brown nubuck leather upper; lineman steel shank;

sizes 7-15; widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 2117 $227.55 $227.55

#1-2 Men's 6-inch ultralight, hiker-style waterproof safety toe boot;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip, and aluminum safety

toe protection; brown/black nubuck leather upper; black/tan

fleck outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red WIng 2146 $198.59 $595.77

#1-3 Men's 8-inch waterproof safety boot for work performed in the 

presence of chemicals; dialed-in precision fit; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip, and puncture, and steel safety toe

protection; brown/black synthetic fiber upper; dual-density

outsole; fiberglass shank; sies 5-15, widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 3591 $260.55 $260.55

#1-4 Men's 6-inch ultralight, hiker-styled waterproof boots; dialed-in 

precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant,

and aluminum safety toe protection; black nubuck upper; black-

tan fleck outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2145 $219.28 $657.84

#1-5 Men's 9-inch leather waterproof  logger safety toe boot; slip, 

oil, heat and chemical resistant; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard and non-metallic safety toe protection; brown full grain

leather; lineman steel shank; aggressive lug sole; sizes 7-15;

widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 2117 $215.14 $215.14

#1-6 Men's 5-inch lightweight romeo safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and aluminum safety

toe protection; fabric covered footbed; non-marking white

outsole; brown full grain leather upper; sizes 6-15; widths D,

EE, and H

PR 1 Worx 5026 $107.57 $107.57

#1-7 Men's light-duty, lightweight safety toe chukka; flexible fabric- 

covered footbed; ASTM-approved static dissipative, slip

resistant, and aluminum safety toe protection; black full grain

leather upper; black non-marking, slip, oil, gas and chemical

resistant outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6814 $157.22 $157.22

#1-8 Men's light-duty, lightweight safety toe chukka; ASTM- 

approved static dissipative, slip resistant, and aluminum safety

toe protection; brown full grain leather upper; white non-

marking, slip, oil, gas and chemical resistant outsole; sizes 6-

15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6819 $157.22 $157.22

#1-9 Men's light-duty, lightweight safety toe slip-on; ASTM- 

approved static dissipative, slip resistant, and aluminum safety

toe protection; black full grain leather upper; black non-

marking, slip, oil, gas and chemical resistant outsole; sizes 6-

15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6814 $157.22 $157.22

#1-11 Men's light duty safety toe oxford; flexible/ breathable black 

upper; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant,

puncture resistant, and aluminum safety toe protection; slip and

abrasion resistant black outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and

H

PR 1 Red Wing 2286 $161.35 $161.35

Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1
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Job No.  240006 Safety Footwear and Related Items for Harris County
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-12 Men's light-duty safety toe oxford; flexible/ breathable

grey/blue upper; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant, puncture resistant, and aluminum safety toe

protection; dialed in precision fit; slip and abrasion resistant

black-tan fleck outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-13 Men's medium duty 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe protection; full-

grain, waterproof espresso leather upper;  oil/gas-, chemical-

and abrasion-resistant outsole; non-metallic shank; sizes 7-15;

widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2452 $231.69 $695.07

#1-14 Men's medium-duty lightweight 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic

safety toe protection; oil/gas and chemical resistant; waterproof

brown nubuck leather upper; 90-degree heel; steel shank; tan

outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2449 $215.14 $645.42

#1-15 Men's medium-duty lightweight safety toe slip on chukka;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; 5-inch brown nubuck upper; 

oil/gas and chemical resistant; oil/gas and chemical resistant;

tan outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2461 $198.59 $198.59

#1-16 Men's light-duty, lightweight 4-inch safety toe hiker boot; 

dialed in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant and aluminum safety toe protection; flexible,

breathable upper; black-tan fleck outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D,

EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6614 $206.87 $206.87

#1-17 Men's light-duty, lightweight safety toe oxford; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and aluminum safety

toe protection; flexible, breathable black upper; black-tan fleck

outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 6800 $153.08 $459.24

#1-18 Men's 17-inch waterproof safety pull-on boot; puncture-

resistant injected polyurethane; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, puncture/slip resistant and steel safety toe protection;

sizes 7-15; width D

PR 1 Red Wing 59006 $140.67 $140.67

#1-19 Men's heavy-duty, lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; 6-inch brown nubuck upper;

suede collar; tan outsole; removable polyurethane footbed; sizes

7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3519 $198.59 $595.77

#1-20 Men's heavy-duty, lightweight 8-inch waterproof safety toe

boot; advanced waterproofed, brown nubuck upper; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic

safety toe protection; suede collar; tan outsole; removable

polyurethane footbed; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2280 $202.73 $608.19

#1-21 Men's heavy-duty, lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot; brown full grain leather upper; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection;

extended suede collar; removable polyurethane footbed; tan

outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Irish Setter 83622 $182.04 $546.12
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-22 Men's heavy-duty, lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe

boot; 6-inch expresso leather upper; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection;

extended suede collar; tan outsole; removable polyurethane

footbed; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2449 $215.14 $645.42

#1-23 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch waterproof, insulated safety toe pull- 

on boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture

resistant, and non-metallic safety toe protection; triple stich toe

and heel overlay; black full grain leather upper; black-grey

outsole; fiberglass shank; size 7-15, widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3555 $264.79 $264.79

#1-24 Men's 11-inch waterproof safety toe pull-on boot; western 10-

row stitching style; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant, and low-profile steel safety toe protection; light gray

rubber outsole; nubuck upper; nylon shank; removable

polyurethane footbed; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 2204 $223.42 $670.26

#1-25 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof, metatarsal guard safety 

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant,

metatarsal guard, and non-metallic safety toe protection; triple

stich toe and heel overlay; black full grain leather upper; black-

gray outsole; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-26 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch premium, waterproof safety toe boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and

non-metallic safety toe protection; triple stitching; four-layer

footbed; black/brown nubuck upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 6-

16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3532 $206.87 $620.61

#1-27 Men's medium-duty, lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot; dialed in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip resistant and aluminum safety toe protection; brown

nubuck upper; nylon shank; removable polyurethane footbed;

lite outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2453 $223.42 $670.26

#1-28 Men's medium-duty, lightweight 8-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant

and aluminum safety toe protection; black full grain leather

upper; removable polyurethane footbed; nylon shank; lite

outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2455 $215.14 $645.42

#1-29 Men's medium-duty, lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and

aluminum safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper;

removable polyurethane footbed; nylon shank; lite outsole;

sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2454 $198.59 $595.77

#1-30 Men's light-duty waterproof safety toe athletic hiker-style work 

shoe; black/gray full grain leather and mesh upper; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and non-metallic

composite safety toe protection; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and

H

PR 3 Irish Setter 83636 $177.90 $533.70

#1-31 Men's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; abrasion 

resistant mesh black upper; dialed in precision fit; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic

composite safety toe protection; black-charcoal outsole; sizes 7-

15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6352 $182.04 $182.04
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-32 Men's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; abrasion

resistant mesh black upper; dialed in precision fit; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic

composite safety toe protection; black outsole; sizes 7-15;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6614 $206.87 $206.87

#1-33 Men's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; abrasion

resistant mesh charcoal and red upper; dialed in precision fit;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and non-

metallic composite safety toe protection; charcoal-red outsole;

sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6343 $182.04 $182.04

#1-34 Men's medium-duty lightweight 6-inch waterproof hiker-style

safety toe boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip/puncture resistant, and non-metallic safety toe protection;

black/brown nubuck upper; removable polyurethane footbed;

black-red outsole; sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Irish Setter 83602 $190.32 $570.96

#1-35 Men's light-duty lightweight and flexible safety toe oxford;

ASTM static-dissipative, slip resistant and non-metallic safety

toe protection;  oil/gas, chemical and heat resistant; black full

grain leather upper; non-metallic shank; black dual density

outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 6337 $124.12 $372.36

#1-36 Men's heavy-duty durable, waterproof 6-inch safety toe boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and

non-metallic safety toe protection; triple stitched toe and heel;

full-grain leather; black full grain leather upper; fiberglass

shank; black-gray outsole; sizes 7-15, widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3532 $206.87 $620.61

#1-37 Men's heavy-duty durable, waterproof 6-inch safety toe boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and

non-metallic safety toe protection; triple stitched toe and heel;

brown and black full-grain leather upper; fiberglass shank;

black-gray outsole; sizes 7-15, widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3532 $206.87 $620.61

#1-38 Men's heavy-duty durable, waterproof 6-inch insulated safety 

toe boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper;

non-metallic shank; 400g insulation; sizes 7-15, widths D, EE,

and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3513 $198.59 $198.59

#1-39 Men's heavy-duty durable, waterproof 8-inch insulated safety 

toe boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; 400g insulation; 

brown nubuck upper; non-metallic shank; sizes 7-15, widths D,

EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3552 $206.87 $206.87

#1-40 Men's light-duty lightweight and flexible safety toe oxford; 

ASTM-approved static dissipation, slip resistant, and non-

metallic safety toe protection; dual-density black outsole;

oil/gas, chemical and heat resistant; brown nubuck upper;

nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-metallic shank; sizes

7-15; width D, EE, and H

PR 1 Worx 6555 $78.60 $78.60

#1-41 Men's light-duty lightweight and flexible safety toe slip-on; 

ASTM-approved static dissipation, slip resistant, and non-

metallic safety toe protection; dual-density black outsole;

oil/gas, chemical and heat resistant; brown nubuck upper;

nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-metallic shank; sizes

7-15; width D, EE, and H

PR 1 Worx 6558 $103.43 $103.43
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-42 Men's light-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe hiker boot;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and

steel safety toe protection; waterproof brown suede upper; oil,

gas, chemical, and heat resistant; nylon shank; gray outsole;

sizes 8-14; widths D and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 3561 $165.49 $496.47

#1-43 Men's light-duty, lightweight safety toe athletic work shoe; 

breathable nylon upper; ASTM electrical hazard protection, slip

resistant and aluminum safety toe; chemical and abrasion

resistant; nylon covered open cell foam footbed; nylon shank;

black outsole; sizes 7-15; width D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6338 $140.67 $140.67

#1-44 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch waterproof, easy-on/easy-off safety

toe pull-on boot; cordovan waterproof nubuck upper; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and steel safety toe

protection; removeable polyurethane footbed; non-metallic

shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 4239 $190.32 $570.96

#1-45 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; reduced 

underfoot pressure; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; reduced underfoot

pressure; brown waterproof nubuck upper; non-metallic shank; 

sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2280 $202.37 $607.11

#1-46 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; reduced 

underfoot pressure; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; reduced underfoot

pressure; brown waterproof nubuck upper; non-metallic shank;

sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2260 $198.59 $595.77

#1-47 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; dual density 

urethane sole; puncture and chemical resistant outer sole;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and

steel safety toe protection; cordovan waterproof full grain

leather upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, E, and

EEE

PR 3 Red Wing 3504 $289.62 $868.86

#1-48 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof, insulated safety boot; 

puncture and chemical resistant outer sole; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and steel safety toe

protection; 400g insulation, black waterproof full grain leather

upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-14; widths B, D, and EEE

PR 1 Red Wing 2244 $206.87 $206.87

#1-49 Men's medium-duty 11-inch waterproof safety toe pull-on boot 

for uneven terrain; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant and aluminum safety toe protection; enhanced insole

cushioning; brown full grain leather upper; nylon covered

polyurethane footbed; non-metallic shank; sizes 7-15; widths

B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 4448 $244.10 $732.30

#1-50 Men's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot for

uneven terrain; leather upper; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and aluminum safety toe protection;

enhanced insole cushioning; brown, waterproof full grain

leather; nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-metallic

shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2454 $198.59 $595.77
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-51 Men's medium-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; oil/gas and chemical resistant;

black, waterproof full grain leather; nylon covered polyurethane

footbed; non-metallic shank; black outsole; sizes 7-15; widths

D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3561 $231.69 $695.07

#1-52 Men's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved slip/puncture resistant, electrical hazard and non-

metallic safety toe protection; slip, oil/gas and chemical

resistant; brown/black full grain leather upper; brown,

waterproof full grain leather; nylon covered polyurethane

footbed; non-metallic shank; black-brown outsole; sizes 7-15;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 5 Red Wing 3519 $198.59 $992.95

#1-53 Men's medium duty 8-inch insulated, waterproof safety toe 

boot; ASTM electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; 800g insulation; oil/gas and

chemical resistant black-brown outsole; brown full grain

leather upper; nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-

metallic shank;  sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3552 $206.87 $206.87

#1-54 Men's 8-inch medium-duty safety toe metatarsal guard boot for 

general work environments; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip resistant, and non-metallic safety toe protection; oil/gas,

chemical, abrasion, and heat resistant outsole; brown full grain

upper; non-metallic shank; sizes 8-14; widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4459 $161.35 $161.35

#1-55 Men's 6-inch medium-duty safety toe metatarsal guard boot for 

general work environments; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip resistant, metatarsal guard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; brown full grain leather upper; non-metallic shank;

oil/gas, chemical, abrasion, and heat resistant black outsole;

sizes 8-14; widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4421 $186.18 $186.18

#1-56 Men's heavy-duty 12-inch waterproof safety pull-on boots for

work with chemicals present; lightweight, waterproof and

chemical-resistant upper extends high up the calf; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe

protection; black-brown upper; non-metallic shank; dual-

density mini lug outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D and EE

PR 1 Irish Setter 83936 $190.32 $190.32

#1-57 Men's light-duty 5-inch safety toe hiker boot; ASTM-approved 

electrical hazard and aluminum safety toe protection; brown

full grain, waterproof leather upper; removable polyurethane

footbed; non-woven insole; nylon shank; slip, oil, gas, chemical

and heat resistant outsole; sizes 8-13; widths D and EE

PR 3 Irish Setter 83644 $177.90 $533.70

#1-58 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch safety toe metatarsal guard boot;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard metatarsal guard, slip

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; single-density, direct-

molded urethane sole; brown nubuck waterproof upper;

fiberglass shank; sizes 8-15; widths D, EE and H

PR 1 Red Wing 4422 $194.45 $194.45

#1-59 Men's 6-inch heavy-duty safety toe metatarsal guard boot;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard metatarsal guard, slip

resistant, and steel safety toe protection; single-density, direct-

molded urethane sole; brown nubuck waterproof upper;

fiberglass shank; sizes 8-15; widths B, D, EE and H

PR 1 Red Wing 4421 $186.18 $186.18
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-60 Men's 11-inch heavy-duty safety toe metatarsal guard pull-on

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, metatarsal guard, slip

resistant and steel safety toe protection; single-density, direct-

molded urethane sole; brown nubuck upper; fiberglass shank;

sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE and H

PR 1 Red Wing 4436 $235.83 $235.83

#1-61 Men's light-duty waterproof safety hiker boot; ASTM-approved 

electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe protection;

brown suede, waterproof upper; nylon shank; oil, gas, chemical

and heat resistant gray outsole; sizes 4-14; widths D and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 2454 $198.59 $595.77

#1-62 Men's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; brown nubuck, waterproof leather upper; non-

metallic shank; oil/gas, chemical, heat, and abrasion resistant

brown outsole; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 6670 $165.49 $496.47

#1-63 Men's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; dialed in

precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-

metallic safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper; nylon

covered polyurethane footbed; non-metallic shank; oil/gas,

chemical, heat, and abrasion resistant brown outsole; sizes 7-

15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2453 $223.42 $670.26

#1-64 Men's heavy-duty 9-inch insulated, waterproof safety toe logger 

boot; aggressive lug black sole for uneven terrain; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe

protection; 400g insulated; brown nubuck upper; nylon covered

polyurethane footbed; lineman steel shank; size 7-15; widths D,

EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 4450 $182.04 $182.04

#1-65 Men's heavy-duty safety toe pull on western style boot; 

waterproof; side stretch panels; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and low profile steel safety toe protection;

decorative 10-row stitching; full grain, waterproof upper;

removable polyurethane footbed; nylon shank; light gray

outsole; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 2204 $223.42 $670.26

#1-66 Men's medium-duty lightweight waterproof safety boot; flat

bottom sole; advanced waterproofing; dark brown nubuck

waterproof upper; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip/puncture resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection;

suede collar top; removable polyurethane footbed; tan outsole;

sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2443 $215.14 $215.14

#1-67 Men's heavy-duty lightweight waterproof safety boot; flat

bottom sole with shallow lugs; cordovan colored full grain

leather upper with triple stitching; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection;

removable polyurethane footbed; tan outsole; rubber-blown

traction tread outsole sizes 7-15; widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 2440 $215.14 $215.14

#1-68 Men's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic

safety toe protection; rubber outsole with lug pattern; four-layer

footbed; brown/black nubuck upper; non-woven insole; non-

metallic shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 4402 $198.59 $595.77
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-69 Men's medium-duty 6-inch side-zip waterproof safety toe boot;

hiker-inspired; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant,

and non-metallic safety toe protection; black full grain,

waterproof upper; removeable polyurethane footbed; non-

woven insole; nylon shank; black-gray outsole; sizes 6-13;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 6617 $198.59 $595.77

#1-70 Men's medium-duty 8-inch insulated, waterproof safety boot;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; 400g insulated; oil/gas-, chemical- and abrasion-

resistant; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3548 $239.97 $239.97

#1-71 Men's medium-duty lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot; dialed-in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip/puncture resistant and aluminum safety toe protection;

brown-black nubuck upper; removable polyurethane footbed;

nylon shank; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2453 $223.42 $223.42

#1-72 Men's heavy-duty, easy-on/easy-off 11-inch safety toe pull-on 

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and steel

safety toe protection; brown full grain upper; steel shank; direct-

molded urethane mini lug sole; sizes 4-16; widths A, AA, B, C,

D, E, EE, AND EEE

PR 3 Irish Setter 83936 $190.32 $570.96

#1-73 Men's heavy-duty 9-inch waterproof safety toe logger boot for 

uneven terrain; aggressive lug sole;  oil and chemical resistant;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and steel

safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper; nylon covered

polyurethane footbed; lineman steel shank; sizes 7-15; widths

D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4443 $256.52 $256.52

#1-74 Men's medium duty, lightweight, 5-inch waterproof safety toe 

hiker boot; dialed-in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection;

oil/gas, and chemical resistant;  black full grain leather upper;

removable polyurethane footbed, non-woven insole; black-gray

outsole; sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 6352 $182.04 $182.04

#1-75 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe protection;

dual-density urethane sole; cordovan full grain leather upper;

fiberglass shank; sizes 6-13; widths A, B, C, D, E, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2415 $206.87 $620.61

#1-76 Men's medium-duty 6-inch safety toe boot for general utility 

use; ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety

toe protection; oil/gas, chemical, and abrasion resistant; sizes 6-

16; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2240 $190.32 $570.96

#1-77 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch safety toe boot for harsh work 

environments; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant

and steel safety toe protection; single density, direct-molded

urethane oil and gas resistant black sole; steel shank; sizes 5-

18; widths A, AA, B, C, D, E, EE, and EEE

PR 1 Red Wing 2409 $231.69 $231.69

#1-78 Men's medium-duty waterproof 8-inch safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; oil/gas, chemical, and abrasion resistant; brown

nubuck, waterproof upper; nylon covered polyurethane

footbed; non-metallic shank; brown outsole; sizes 7-15; widths

D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2280 $202.73 $608.19
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Job No.  240006 Safety Footwear and Related Items for Harris County

Item No. Description Unit

of

Measure

Estimated

Quantity

Brand

Name

Part

No.

Unit

Price

Total

Price

Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-79 Men's heavy-duty waterproof 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and non-

metallic safety toe protection; triple stitched toe and heel

overlays; brown full grain leather waterproof upper; fiberglass

shank; black-gray outsole sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3532 $206.87 $206.87

#1-80 Men's heavy duty 6-inch safety boot; waterproof; dual-density 

urethane sole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant

and steel safety toe protection; soft inner sole; puncture- and

chemical-resistant outer back sole; black full grain waterproof

upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3507 $227.55 $227.55

#1-81 Men's light-duty lightweight chukka; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and aluminum safety

toe protection; high-rebound cushioning; black full grain

leather upper; black outsole; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3564 $140.67 $140.67

#1-82 Men's heavy duty 11-inch toe pull on boot; dual-density

urethane sole; soft inner sole provides underfoot cushioning;

chemical-resistant outer sole; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and steel safety toe protection;

brown full grain oiled leather; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3505 $244.10 $732.30

#1-83 Men's medium-duty lightweight side-zip, waterproof 6-inch 

safety toe boots; hiker style; puncture-resistant outsole; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; black waterproof and waxed full

grain leather; removable polyurethane footbed; black-beluga

outsole; sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-84 Men's light-duty lightweight 5-inch safety toe chukka; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and

aluminum safety toe protection; footbed high-rebound

cushioning; brown full grain upper; white outsole; sizes 6-15;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3505 $157.22 $157.22

#1-85 Men's heavy duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; triple stitched heel and toe

overlays; brown waterproof full grain upper; fiberglass shank;

black-gray outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3030 $169.63 $508.89

#1-86 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe protection;

brown oiled and  waxed nubuck upper; non-metallic shank;

size: 6-16; widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 4469 $206.87 $620.61

#1-87 Men's medium-duty, hiker style safety toe metatarsal boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, metatarsal guard and non-

metallic safety toe protection; oil/gas, chemical, and abrasion

resistant; brown nubuck upper; nylon  covered polyurethane

footbed; non-metallic shank; brown outsole; size 7-15; widths d

and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4421 $186.18 $186.18

#1-88 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch steel safety toe boot; ASTM-approved 

electrical hazard, slip resistant and steel safety toe protection; 

dual-density urethane sole; chemical and abrasion resistant

outsole; sizes 6-16; cordovan water full grain upper; fiberglass

shank; widths B, D, E, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2408 $235.83 $235.83
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Job No.  240006 Safety Footwear and Related Items for Harris County

Item No. Description Unit

of

Measure

Estimated

Quantity

Brand

Name

Part

No.

Unit

Price

Total

Price

Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-89 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch safety toe boot; reduced underfoot

pressure; built-in insole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant and steel safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper;

non-metallic shank; sizes 6-16;widths B, D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2493 $231.69 $695.07

#1-90 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch safety toe pull-on boot; dual-density 

urethane sole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture

resistant and steel safety toe protection; soft inner sole;

puncture- and chemical-resistant outer sole; cordovan full grain

upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3553 $231.69 $231.69

#1-91 Men's medium-duty lightweight waterproof hiker-style safety 

toe boot with side zipper; puncture resistant outsole; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant, and non-

metallic safety toe protection; black full grain upper; removable

polyurethane footbed; black-beluga outsole; sizes 6-16; widths

D, EE, and H

PR 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#1-92 Men's light-duty, lightweight 5-inch safety toe chukka; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard and aluminum safety toe protection;

slip and puncture resistant; high-rebound cushioning in

footbed; brown full-grain leather upper; white outsole; sizes 6-

15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3563 $161.35 $161.35

#1-93 Men's medium-duty 6-inch safety toe metatarsal hiker-style

boot;  ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-metallic

safety toe protection; oil/gas, chemical and abrasion resistant;

brown full-grain upper; brown outsole; sizes 7-15; widths D

and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4421 $186.18 $186.18

#1-94 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; triple-stitched toe and heel overlays; brown full-

grain leather upper; black-gray dual-density outsole;  sizes 7-

15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 4218 $215.14 $645.42

#1-95 Men's medium-duty 6-inch insulated, waterproof safety toe 

boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety

toe protection; oil/gas, chemical and abrasion resistant; 400g

insulated; nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-metallic

shank; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3513 $198.59 $198.59

#1-96 Men's heavy duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; flat-

bottom sole with shallow lugs; brown triple stitched full-grain

leather upper; ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-

metallic safety toe protection; slip resistant; removable

polyurethane footbed; sizes 7-15; widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 2415 $206.87 $206.87

#1-97 Men's heavy-duty 10-inch waterproof safety toe metatarsal

guard boot; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, metatarsal

guard, slip resistant and steel toe protection; double-stitched

brown-black nubuck leather upper; steel shank; sizes 7-16;

widths D and EE

PR 1 Red Wing 4499 $227.55 $227.55

#1-98 Men's heavy duty 8-inch safety toe boot; dual-density urethane 

sole; soft inner sole;  puncture- and chemical-resistant outer

sole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip, puncture, and

steel safety toe protection; full-grain, waterproof cordovan

leather upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 7-16; widths B, D, EE,

and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2414 $293.75 $293.75
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-99 Men's medium-duty 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

static dissipative and non-metallic safety toe protection; oil/gas-

, chemical- and abrasion-resistant; brown waterproof nubuck

upper; non-metallic shank; sizes 6-14; widths D and EE

PR 3 Irish Setter 83230 $204.99 $614.97

#1-100 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; triple

stitched black and brown nubuck upper; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip, puncture, and non-metallic safety toe

protection; fiberglass shank; sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3532 $206.87 $620.61

#1-101 Men's heavy-duty 9-inch waterproof safety all-terrain toe logger 

boot; aggressive sole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip,

puncture, and steel safety toe protection; advanced

waterproofing; brown nubuck upper; lineman steel shank; sizes

7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Irish Setter 83834 $153.08 $153.08

#1-102 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; soft inner 

sole; puncture and chemical resistant outer sole; waterproof

lining; cordovan full grain leather upper; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip, puncture, and steel safety toe protection;

fiberglass shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D, E, and EEE

PR 1 Red Wing 2414 $293.75 $293.75

#1-103 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch safety toe pull-on boot; easy-on and 

easy-off; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip, and steel

safety toe protection; dark brown full grain leather waterproof

upper; fiberglass shank; black outsole; sizes 7-15; widths B, D,

EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2272 $239.97 $719.91

#1-104 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip, puncture, and non-metallic

safety toe protection; brown and black nubuck leather triple

stitched upper; fiberglass shank; black outsole; sizes 6-16;

widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3520 $273.07 $819.21

#1-105 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch safety toe pull-on boot;  dual-density 

urethane sole; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip, and steel

safety toe protection; cordovan full grain leather waterproof

upper; fiberglass shank; outsole resistant to chemicals and

abrasion; sizes 6-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2405 $231.69 $695.07

#1-106 Men's light-duty waterproof safety hiker style boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip, and aluminum safety toe

protection; oil, gas, chemical and heat resistant outsole; brown

nubuck leather upper; steel shank; sizes 7-15; widths B, D and

EE

PR 3 Irish Setter 83400 $161.35 $484.05

#1-107 Men's medium-duty lightweight 6-inch waterproof safety toe 

boot for general work environments; dialed in precision fit;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip, and non-metallic safety

toe protection; oil, gas, chemical and abrasion resistant black

outsole; brown nubuck waterproof leather upper; non-metallic

shank; sizes 7-15; widths D and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 4216 $206.87 $620.61

#1-108 Men's medium-duty, lightweight 8-inch waterproof safety toe 

hiker-style boot; dialed in precision fit; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip, puncture, and non-metallic safety toe

protection; oil, gas, and chemical resistant black/red outsole;

brown nubuck leather upper; removable polyurethane footbed;

sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 3531 $206.87 $620.61
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#1-109 Men's heavy-duty, insulated, waterproof 9-inch safety toe

logger boot; aggressive lug sole; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip, and steel safety toe protection; oil and chemical

resistant black sole; brown nubuck leather upper; removable

polyurethane footbed; lineman steel shank; sizes 7-156; widths

D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 2219 $297.89 $297.89

#1-110 Men's medium-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip, puncture, metatarsal and non-

metallic safety toe protection; four-layer footbed; brown

nubuck leather upper; sizes 7-15; widths D, EE, and H

PR 1 Red Wing 3516 $206.87 $206.87

#1-111 Men's heavy-duty 8-inch insulated, waterproof safety toe boot; 

soft inner sole; 400g insulation; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip, puncture, and steel safety toe protection; cordovan

full grain leather upper; fiberglass shank; sizes 6-15; widths B,

D, E, and EEE

PR 1 Red Wing 4404 $235.83 $235.83

#1-112 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; triple stitched 

black full grain leather upper; four-layer footbed; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip, and non-metallic safety toe

protection; fiberglass shank; sizes 6-16; widths D, EE, and H

PR 3 Red Wing 2411 $256.52 $769.56

#1-113 Men's heavy-duty 6-inch safety toe boot for harsh 

environments; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip,

puncture, and steel safety toe protection; oil and gas resistant;

brown full grain leather upper; steel shank; single-density,

direct-molded urethane sole; size 6-16; widths B, D, E, EE, and

EEE

PR 3 Red Wing 5906 $124.12 $372.36

#1-114 Men's heavy-duty 11-inch insulated safety toe pull-on  boot; 

easy-on and easy-off; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip,

and steel safety toe protection; 400g insulation; cordovan full

grain leather; oil and gas resistant single-density, direct-molded

urethane sole; steel shank; sizes 6-14; widths D and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 4441 $239.97 $719.91

Subtotal No. 1 $45,028.12

2. Women's Safety Toe Footwear

#2-1 Women's 6-inch insulated waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe

protection; oil/gas-, chemical- abrasion and puncture-resistant

brown outsole; brown waterproof nubuck upper; removeable

polyurethane footbed; sizes 5-11; widths B, D and EE

PR 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-2 Women's 5-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ultralight hiker-

styled; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and

aluminum safety toe protection; gray nubuck upper; black-tan

fleck outsole; sizes 5-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 2328 $148.94 $446.82

#2-3 Women's 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip resistant; and aluminum safety toe

protection; black nubuck upper; removable polyurethane

footbed; nylon shank; extremely lite outsole; sizes 5-11; width

B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 2346 $182.04 $546.12

#2-4 Women's 6-inch sure fit waterproof safety toe boot; dial-in 

precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard and aluminum

safety toe protection; brown full grain waterproof upper;

removable polyurethane footbed; nylon shank; extremely lite

outsole; sizes 5-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 2145 $219.28 $657.84
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#2-5 Women's medium duty 6-inch safety toe boot; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard and non-metallic safety toe protection; brown

full-grain, waterproof leather upper; oil/gas-, chemical- and

abrasion-resistant; nylon covered polyurethane footbed; non-

metallic shank; brown outsole; sizes 5-11; widths B, D, and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 2347 $219.28 $657.84

#2-6 Women's light-duty 5-inch side zip safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard and aluminum safety toe protection;

brown full-grain, leather upper; side zipper; white outsole; sizes

6.5-9; widths B and D

PR 1 Red Wing 2036 $148.94 $148.94

#2-7 Women's safety toe chukka; extremely lightweight; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant, and aluminum safety

toe protection; high rebound cushioning; extremely light white

outsole; brown full-grain leather upper; non-woven insole; sizes

6-9.5; widths B and D

PR 1 Red Wing 2035 $148.94 $148.94

#2-8 Women's medium-duty 6-inch safety toe hiker boot; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; advanced waterproofing; black

nubuck upper; removable polyurethane footbed; non-woven

insole; black-gray outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 2345 $182.04 $546.12

#2-9 Women's heavy-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; ASTM- 

approved electrical hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; cordovan full-grain, waterproof

leather upper; triple stitched overlay; fiberglass shank;

fiberglass shank; black-gray outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and

D

PR 3 Irish Setter 83236 $161.35 $484.05

#2-10 Women's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; lightweight;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-

metallic composite safety toe protection; abrasion resistant

outsole; breathable and instant cooling upper; gray-purple

outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D;

PR 3 Red Wing 5157 $115.48 $346.44

#2-11 Women's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; lightweight; 

dial-in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant and non-metallic composite safety toe protection;

abrasion resistant outsole; breathable and instant cooling upper;

black-teal outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-12 Women's medium-duty 5-inch waterproof safety toe boot; 

ASTM-approved electrical hazard and non-metallic composite

safety toe protection; oil/gas-, chemical- and abrasion-

resistance; brown nubuck waterproof upper; nylon covered

polyurethane footbed; non-metallic shank; brown outsole; sizes

5-11; widths B, D, and EE

PR 3 Red Wing 2340 $182.04 $546.12

#2-13 Women's medium-duty 8-inch waterproof safety toe boot; 

lightweight; flat-bottom white sole; ASTM-approved electrical

hazard, slip/puncture resistant and non-metallic composite

safety toe protection; black full grain waterproof upper;

removable polyurethane footbed; sizes 5-11; widths B and D

PR 1 Irish Setter 83218 $177.80 $177.80

#2-14 Women's light-duty safety toe athletic work shoe; lightweight; 

dial-in precision fit; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip

resistant and non-metallic composite safety toe protection;

abrasion resistant outsole; breathable and instant cooling gray-

teal upper; black-tan fleck outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D;

PR 3 Red Wing 2343 $153.08 $459.24
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Red Wing Brands of America, Inc.
1

#2-15 Women's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; triple

stitch toe and heel overlays; ASTM-approved electrical hazard,

slip resistant and non-metallic safety toe protection; brown full

grain, waterproof grey-teal upper; fiberglass chank; black-gray

outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Irish Setter 83216 $190.32 $570.96

#2-16 Women's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; hiker

inspired; advanced waterproof technology; ASTM-approved

electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic  safety toe

protection; brown nubuck upper; removable polyurethane

footbed; non-woven insole; nylon shank; black-turquoise

outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 3542 $190.32 $570.96

#2-17 Women's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety boot; hiker 

inspired; dial-in precision fit; advanced waterproof technology;

ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-

metallic safety toe protection; brown nubuck upper; removable

polyurethane footbed; non-woven insole; nylon shank; black-

turquoise outsole; sizes 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

#2-18 Women's heavy-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; crepe 

colored flat-bottom sole; brown nubuck leather upper; ASTM-

approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and non-metallic 

safety toe protection; extended suede collar; removable

polyurethane footbed; sizes 5-11; widths B and D

PR 1 Red Wing 2030 $148.94 $148.94

#2-19 Women's medium-duty 6-inch waterproof safety toe boot; hiker 

inspired; ASTM-approved electrical hazard, slip resistant and

non-metallic safety toe protection; advanced waterproofing

technology; black nubuck upper; removable polyurethane

footbed; non-woven insole; nylon shank; black-gray outsole;

size 6-11; widths B and D

PR 3 Red Wing 2345 $182.04 $546.12

Subtotal No. 2 7,003.25$      

Grand Total 52,031.37$    

1 
 Award Recommendation Only Bid

 Items 1-25, 1-83, 1-91, 2-1, 2-11 and 2-17 will not be awarded.
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