DeWight Dopslauf, C.P.M., CPPO
Harris County Purchasing Agent

September 02, 2021

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE: Job No. 210205
Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of low bid subject to applicable bond(s) to be
received from the vendor(s):

Description: Resurfacing and Striping of Tom Bass 2 Model Airplane Park for Harris County

Precinct 1
Bid(s) Received: Three (3) on July 26, 2021 (see attached)
Vendor(s): Main Lane Industries, Ltd.
Amount: $85,758

Evaluated By: < Harris County Purchasing e« Office of the County Engineer

Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,
Dt s
DeWight Dopslauf
Purchasing Agent
MM
Attachment(s)

cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA SEPTEMBER 14, 2021

.
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Job No. 210205; Resurfacing and Striping of Tom Bass 2 Model Airplane Park for Harris County Precinct |

Main Lane Industries,
1

Ltd. WadeCon, LLC AJB Construction, Inc.
Estimatedd Unit Unit Unit
# Items ID Description Unit of Measure Quantity Price Total Price Price Total Price Price Total Price
#0-1 [SITE PREPARATION |PLANS PROJECT SIGN 1 EA 1 $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 | $55,303.50 | $55,303.50
AND EARTHWORK
#0-2 [SITE PREPARATION [HCED 0309 [MILL EXISTING ASPHALT, DEPTH AS SY 3890 $5 $19,450.00 $10 $38,900.00 No Bid No Bid
AND EARTHWORK DIRECTED BY ENGINEER
#0-3 [SUBGRADE AND HCED 0340 |FURNISH/INSTALL HMAC TON 423 $122 $51,606.00 $120 $50,760.00 $129.50 $54,778.50
PAVING
#0-4 [SUBGRADE AND HCED 0340 |TACK COAT GAL 506 $1 $506 $5 $2,530.00 No Bid No Bid
PAVING
#0-5 [SUBGRADE AND HCED 0530 | CONCRETE SLOTTED CURB LF 66 $93 $6,138.00 $30 $1,980.00 No Bid No Bid
PAVING
#0-6 |[EXTRA WORK ITEMS [HCED 0537 [WHEEL STOPS EA 26 $63 $1,638.00 $200 $5,200.00 $350 $9,100.00
#0-7 |[EXTRA WORK ITEMS |HCED 0671 [TRAFFIC CONTROL MO 1 $3,500.00 [ $3,500.00 | $10,000.00 | $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid
#0-8 [EXTRA WORK ITEMS [HCED 0660 [REFLECTORIZED PAVEMENT MARKINGS LF 2700 $0.60 $1,620.00 $1 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid
#0-9 |EXTRA WORK ITEMS [HCED 0660 ([REFLECTORIZED PAVEMENT MARKINGS EA 2 $150 $300 $500 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid
ADA PARKING SYMBOL
Grand Total $85,758.00 $116,070.00 $119,182.00

' Award Recommendation Low Bid
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