
November 15, 2021

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE:    Job No. 210354

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of lowest complete bid:

Description: Traffic Paint and Related Items for Harris County

Bid(s) Received: Four (4) on November 08, 2021 (see attached)

Vendor(s): Trantex Transportation Products of Texas Inc.

Term: December 01, 2021 - November 30, 2022 with four (4) one-year renewal options

Amount: $163,430

Evaluated By: • Harris County Purchasing 
• Precinct 4

• Precinct 1

Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

DeWight Dopslauf
Purchasing Agent

JW 
Attachment(s)
cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA NOVEMBER 30, 2021



Job No. 210354 - Traffic Paint and Related Items for Harris County

Item No. Description Unit of Measure Estimated Quantity Brand/Manufacturer Product No.  Unit Price  Total Price Brand/Manufacturer Model No.  Unit Price  Total Price Brand/Manufacturer Model No.  Unit Price  Total Price Brand/Manufacturer Model No.

 Unit

Price  Total Price

A Traffice Paint

1 White - 5 Gallon Containers EA 650 Allstates Coating ALT-100TX 72.25$      46,962.50$     Aexcel 20200-000 99.00$           64,350.00$          Ennis-Flint 984301-5P 77.50$      50,375.00$     Childress 14205-PW5G  84.95$  55,217.50$     

2 White - 55 Gallon Containers EA 40 Allstates Coating ALT-100TX 759.00$    30,360.00$     Aexcel 12W-D110 420.00$         16,800.00$          Ennis-Flint 984301-55RL 825.00$    33,000.00$     Childress 14205-DR55 714.45$  28,578.00$     

3 Yellow - 5 Gallon Containers EA 600 Allstates Coating ALT-101TX 74.50$      44,700.00$     Aexcel 20201-000 104.00$         62,400.00$          Ennis-Flint 984302-5P 77.50$      46,500.00$     Childress 24205-PY5G  84.95$    50,970.00$     

4 White - 55 Gallon Containers EA 40 Allstates Coating  ALT-101TX 783.00$    31,320.00$     Aexcel 12Y-D243 430.00$         17,200.00$          Ennis-Flint 984302-55RL 825.00$    33,000.00$     Childress 24205-DR55 714.45$  28,578.00$     

Sub Total of A 153,342.50$   160,750.00$        162,875.00$   163,343.50$   

B Thermoplastic Road Markings

4 White - 50 lb. Container EA 1000 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  Swarco 20801-100S 58.00$           1,000.00$            Ennis-Flint 885202 35.00$      35,000.00$     Childress 11205-00 36.38$    36,380.00$     

5 Yellow - 50 lb. Container EA 40 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  Swarco 20800-100S 42.00$           1,680.00$            Ennis-Flint 886441 35.00$      1,400.00$      Childress 21205-00 36.38$    1,455.20$      

Sub Total of B NO BID 2,680.00$            36,400.00$     37,835.20$     

Grand Total of A & B 153,342.50$   163,430.00$        199,275.00$   201,178.70$   
1
Award Recommendation Lowest Complete Bid

Allstates Coating Company Trantex Transportation Products of Texas Inc.
1 

Ennis-Flint, Inc. Ozark Materials, LLC
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