
June 25, 2025

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE:    Job No. 240361

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of only bid:

Description: Crash Cushion Parts for SMART Cushion Crash Attenuator, Mounting Hardware,
and Related Items for the Harris County Toll Road Authority

Bid(s) Received: One (1) on April 28, 2025 (see attached)

Vendor(s): Altus Traffic Management, LLC dba AWP Safety

Term: July 10, 2025 - July 09, 2026 with four (4) one-year renewal options

Amount: $1,131,581

Evaluated By: • Harris County Purchasing • Toll Road Authority

Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

Paige McInnis
Purchasing Agent

PJA
Attachment(s)
cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA JULY 10, 2025



Job No. 24/0361 - Crash Cushion Parts for SMART Cushion Crash Attenuator, Mounting Hardware, and Related Items for the Harris County Toll Road Authority

Item

No. Description Part No. 

Unit of 

Measure 

Estimated

Quantity Unit Price Total Price

1 TL2

#1-1 SLED TL2 274649 EA 5 $ 2,995.89 $14,979.45

#1-2 Mobile Frame 4 272217 EA 5 $ 567.57 $2,837.85

#1-3 Mobile Frame 5 272218 EA 5 $ 567.57 $2,837.85

#1-4 Mobile Frame 6 272219 EA 5 $ 567.57 $2,837.85

#1-5 Terminal Brace 5 270770 EA 5 $ 606.38 $3,031.90

#1-6 Sled Panel 273402 EA 5 $ 638.28 $3,191.40

#1-7 Side Panel 273401 EA 20 $ 282.17 $5,643.40

#1-8 Rear Panel 273399 EA 5 $ 249.83 $1,249.15

#1-9 Sled Side Keeper #3 272597 EA 5 $ 40.02 $200.10

#1-10 Center Side Keeper #1 272593 EA 20 $ 36.39 $727.80

#1-11 Rear Side Keeper #2 272595 EA 5 $ 36.39 $181.95

#1-12 TL2 Gore Delineator Panel (Instead could be left - 273928 or right - 273388) 273382 EA 10 $ 229.21 $2,292.10

#1-13 Concrete Anchor Bolt (Kit of 34) 270667 EA 10 $ 409.92 $4,099.20

#1-14 Asphalt Anchor Bolt (Kit of 34) N/A EA 5 $ 499.65 $2,498.25

#1-15 Shear Bolt 270683 EA 250 $ 2.43 $607.50

#1-16 28 oz. Epoxy Cartridge & Nozzle (Concrete) 271242 EA 20 $ 54.57 $1,091.40

#1-17 28 oz. Epoxy Cartridge & Nozzle (Asphalt) N/A EA 10 $ 54.57 $545.70

#1-18 Boot Cylinder TL2 270707 EA 5 $ 76.41 $382.05

#1-19 Front Pin Anti-Rotation 273590 EA 10 $ 83.68 $836.80

#1-20 Rear Pin Anti-Rotation 273608 EA 10 $ 86.11 $861.10

#1-21 Plate Cover for Front & Rear Anti-Rotation 273667 EA 2 $ 50.94 $101.88

#1-22 Cable N/A EA 1 No Bid No Bid

#1-23 TL3 Cylinder N/A EA 1 No Bid No Bid

#1-24 SCI70GM-CA TL II Crash Attenuator – Concrete 270126-C EA 4 $ 18,711.0 $74,844.00

#1-25 SCI70GM-AA TL II Crash Attenuator – Asphalt 270126-A EA 2 $ 19,157.25 $38,314.50

2 TL3

#2-1 SLED TL3 274649 EA 5 $ 3,185.9 $15,929.50

Altus Traffic Management, LLC dba

AWP Safety
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Job No. 24/0361 - Crash Cushion Parts for SMART Cushion Crash Attenuator, Mounting Hardware, and Related Items for the Harris County Toll Road Authority

#2-2 Mobile Frame 1 272214 EA 15 $ 567.57 $8,513.55

#2-3 Mobile Frame 2 272215 EA 25 $ 567.57 $14,189.25

#2-4 Mobile Frame 3 272216 EA 35 $ 567.57 $19,864.95

#2-5 Mobile Frame 4 272217 EA 45 $ 567.57 $25,540.65

#2-6 Mobile Frame 5 272218 EA 55  $ 567.57 $31,216.35

#2-7 Mobile Frame 6 272219 EA 65 $ 567.57 $36,892.05

#2-8 Terminal Brace 270770 EA 5 $ 606.38 $3,031.90

#2-9 Sled Panel 273402 EA 5 $ 638.28 $3,191.40

#2-10 Side Panel 273401 EA 20 $ 282.17 $5,643.40

#2-11 Rear Panel 273399 EA 55  $ 249.83 $13,740.65

#2-12 Sled Side Keeper #3 272597 EA 5 $ 40.02 $200.10

#2-13 Center Side Keeper #1 272593 EA 20 $ 36.39 $727.80

#2-14 Rear Side Keeper #2 272595 EA 5 $ 36.39 $181.95

#2-15 TL3 Gore Delineator Panel (Instead could be left - 273383 or right - 273389) 273381 EA 10 $ 243.76 $2,437.60

#2-16 Concrete Anchor Bolt (Kit of 48) 270667 EA 10 $ 551.8 $5,518.00

#2-17 Asphalt Anchor Bolt (Kit of 48) N/A EA 5 $ 796.77 $3,983.85

#2-18 Shear Bolt 270683 EA 250  $ 2.43 $607.50

#2-19 28 oz. Epoxy Cartridge & Nozzle (Concrete) 271242 EA 20 $ 54.57 $1,091.40

#2-20 28 oz. Epoxy Cartridge & Nozzle (Asphalt) N/A EA 10 $ 54.57 $545.70

#2-21 Boot Cylinder TL3 270707 EA 5 $ 76.41 $382.05

#2-22 Front Pin Anti-Rotation 273590 EA 10 $ 83.68 $836.80

#2-23 Rear Pin Anti-Rotation 273608 EA 10 $ 86.11 $861.10

#2-24 Plate Cover for Front & Rear Anti-Rotation 273667 EA 2 $ 50.94 $101.88

#2-25 Cable N/A EA 1 No Bid No Bid

#2-26 TL3 Cylinder N/A EA 1 No Bid No Bid

#2-27 SCI100GM Smart Cushion TL III (Concrete) 270128-C EA 10 $ 24,396.75 $243,967.50

#2-28 SCI100GM Smart Cushion TL III (Asphalt) 270128-A EA 5 $ 25,026.75 $125,133.75

#2-29 Transition Jersey Barrier – Right 275297 EA 5 $ 1,869.0 $9,345.00

#2-30 Transition Jersey Barrier – Left 275294 EA 5 $ 1,869.0 $9,345.00

#2-31 Transition 24" Concrete - Left & Right 275263 EA 5 $ 1,173.84 $5,869.20

#2-32 Transition Thrie Beam – Right 275298 EA 5 $ 1,695.43 $8,477.15

#2-33 Transition Thrie Beam – Left 232971 EA 5 $ 1,695.43 $8,477.15

#2-34 Transition Assembly 30" Concrete Straight Connection 275279 EA 5 $ 3,345.98 $16,729.90

#2-35 Transition Assembly 36" Concrete Straight Connection 275283 EA 5 $ 5,881.84 $29,409.20
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Job No. 24/0361 - Crash Cushion Parts for SMART Cushion Crash Attenuator, Mounting Hardware, and Related Items for the Harris County Toll Road Authority

#2-36 Transition 30" Concrete Straight Connection 275265  EA 5 $ 1,599.62 $7,998.10

#2-37 Transition 36" Concrete Straight Connection 275267  EA 5 $ 2,128.38 $10,641.90

#2-38 Transition Concrete Spanner Brace 275291  EA 5 $ 1,324.32 $6,621.60

#2-39 Thrie Beam Concrete Leg Brace 270765  EA 5 $ 1,104.82 $5,524.10

#2-40 Transition Assembly Gore to End of Flared Transition 275288  EA 5 $ 8,650.54 $43,252.70

#2-41 Transition Rub Rail Median Barrier – Right 275271  EA 5 $ 738.56 $3,692.80

#2-42 Transition Rub Rail Median Barrier – Left 275270  EA 5 $ 738.56 $3,692.80

#2-43 Transition Single Slope 24-26 9/32" Wide Median Barrier – Right 275299  EA 5 $ 2,070.17 $10,350.85

#2-44 Transition Single Slope 24-26 9/32" Wide Median Barrier – Left 275302 EA 5 $ 2,070.17 $10,350.85

#2-45 Transition W Beam 28" - High Right 275309  EA 5 $ 2,150.2 $10,751.00

#2-46 Transition W Beam 28" - High Left 275307  EA 5 $ 2,150.2 $10,751.00

#2-47 Transition W Beam 32" - High Right 275311  EA 5 $ 1,975.57 $9,877.85

#2-48 Transition W Beam 32" - High Left 275310  EA 5 $ 1,975.57 $9,877.85

#2-49 Transition Support Bracket - Right 5 239471 EA 5 $ 756.76 $3,783.80

#2-50 Transition Support Bracket – Left 239472 EA 5 $ 756.76 $3,783.80

#2-51 Transition Assembly Variable Width Median Barrier with Rub Rails 239542 EA 5 $ 6,494.28 $32,471.40

#2-52 Transition Assembly Variable Width Median Barrier w/out Rub Rails 239545  EA 5 $ 5,348.23 $26,741.15

#2-53 Transition Spanner - Left & Right 251641  EA 5 $ 1,364.34 $6,821.70

#2-54 Transition Assembly - 38" Wide Block 254621  EA 5 $ 4,897.09 $24,485.45

#2-55 Transition Assembly - 40" Wide Block 254622 EA 5 $ 4,924.98 $24,624.90

#2-56 Transition Assembly - 42" Wide Block 254623 EA 5 $ 4,997.74 $24,988.70

#2-57 Transition Assembly - 31+" Offset Block 254627  EA 5 $ 2,554.06 $12,770.30

#2-58 Block End Shoe 10 Degree 21" 254630  EA 5 $ 1,032.9 $5,164.50

#2-59 Transition Panel Block Face 255878  EA 5 $ 1,277.02 $6,385.10

Grand Total $1,131,580.61

Bid Recommendation - Only Bid Received
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