
November 15, 2021

Commissioners Court
Harris County, Texas

RE:    Job No. 210345

Members of Commissioners Court:

Please approve the following award on the basis of lowest complete bid:

Description: Batteries for Automobiles, Trucks, Commercial, Marine, Lawn Equipment and
Related Items for Harris County

Bid(s) Received: Five (5) on October 25, 2021 (see attached)

Vendor(s): IEH AUTO PARTS LLC  (Primary)
Parts Authority, LLC  (Secondary)
Interstate Battery Systems of Houston  (Tertiary)

Term: November 30, 2021 - October 31, 2022 with four (4) one-year renewal options

Amount: $404,043

Evaluated By: • Harris County Purchasing • Universal Services - Fleet

After evaluating the bids, it was determined that it is in the best interest of Harris County to award a
primary, secondary, and tertiary vendor to ensure complete coverage of these services. The
secondary and tertiary vendors will be utilized when the primary vendor is unavailable or unable to
fulfill services required. Purchase order(s) will be issued upon Commissioners Court approval.

Sincerely,

DeWight Dopslauf
Purchasing Agent

JW 
Attachment(s)
cc: Vendor(s)

FOR INCLUSION ON COMMISSIONERS COURT AGENDA NOVEMBER 30, 2021



Job No. 210345 - Batteries for Automobiles, Trucks, Commercial, Marine, Lawn Equipment and Related Items for Harris County

Page 1 of 1

Item No. Description Unit of Measure

Estimated

Quantity

Manufacturer 

Name 

Part 

No. 

Unit 

Price 

Total

Price

Manufacturer

Name

Part 

No. 

Unit

Price

Total

Price

Manufacturer

Name

Part

No.

Unit

Price

Total

Price

Manufacturer 

Name 

Part 

No. 

Unit

Price

Total

Price

Manufacturer

Name

Part 

No. 

Unit

Price

Total

Price

A Batteries

1 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 24, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 350, reserve cap. in minutes - 90 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 24-600CH $ 61.06 305.30$            Exide S24 $ 68.82 344.10$            Interstate Batteries M-24 $ 66.18 330.90$            DIEHARD 24FT-5 $ 116.57 582.85$            

2 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I, BCI# - 27, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 700, reserve cap. in minutes - 135 EA 10 East Penn BT27FP71EXCH 110.00$    1,100.00 $         Champion 27-810CH $ 88.08 880.80$            Exide SX27 $ 90.13 901.30$            Interstate Batteries M-27 $ 66.18 661.80$            DIEHARD 27-3 $ 103.17 1,031.70$         

3 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, BCI# - 34, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 700, reserve cap. in minutes - 110 EA 550 East Penn BT48P71EXCH $ 88.12 48,466.00 $       Champion 34-700CH $ 73.12 40,216.00$       Exide S34 $ 81.23 44,676.50$       Interstate Batteries MT-34 $ 91.76 50,468.00$       DIEHARD 34FT-2 $ 116.57 64,113.50$       

4 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, BCI# - 48, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 770, reserve cap. in minutes - 120 EA 220 East Penn BT48P72EXCH $ 112.12 24,666.40 $       Continental COHL3H648CP $ 95.51 21,012.20$       Exide S-H6/L3/48 $ 91.22 20,068.40$       Interstate Batteries MTP-48/H6 $ 110.46 24,301.20$       DIEHARD 48H6 $ 116.57 25,645.40$       

5 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 65, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 850, reserve cap. in minutes - 145 EA 500 East Penn BT65P81EXCH 115.00$    57,500.00 $       Champion 65-850CHP $ 84.3 42,150.00$       Exide S65 $ 75.86 37,930.00$       Interstate Batteries M-65HC $ 83.27 41,635.00$       DIEHARD 65-2 $ 116.57 58,285.00$       

6 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, #MTP-65, BCI# - 65, CA - 1000, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 850, reserve cap. in minutes - 150 EA 500 East Penn BT65P81EXCH $ 115 57,500.00 $       Champion 65-850CHP $ 84.3 42,150.00$       Exide SX65 $ 92.54 46,270.00$       Interstate Batteries MTP-65HD $ 99.12 49,560.00$       DIEHARD 65-2 $ 116.57 58,285.00$       

7 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 75, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 575, reserve cap. in minutes - 105 EA 25 East Penn BT75/86P61EXCH $ 77.05 1,926.25 $         Champion 75-650CH $ 64.12 1,603.00$         Exide S75 $ 69.82 1,745.50$         Interstate Batteries MT-75 $ 91.76 2,294.00$         DIEHARD 75-2 $ 103.17 2,579.25$         

8 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 78, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 550, reserve cap. in minutes - 130 EA 140 East Penn BT78P51 $ 78.99 11,058.60 $       Champion 78-700CH $ 65.74 9,203.60$         Exide S78 $ 76.59 10,722.60$       Interstate Batteries M-78 $ 66.18 9,265.20$         DIEHARD 78-1 $ 103.17 14,443.80$       

9 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, # MTP-78, BCI# - 78, CA - 1000, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 800, reserve cap. in minutes - 110 EA 100 East Penn BT78P81 $ 102.3 10,230.00 $       Champion 78-800CHP $ 83.12 8,312.00$         Exide SX78 $ 95.03 9,503.00$         Interstate Batteries MTP-78 $ 107.91 10,791.00$       DIEHARD 78FT-2 $ 116.57 11,657.00$       

10 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent -J.C.I., BCI# - 3478, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 710, reserve cap. in minutes - 135 EA 450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 34/78DT800CH $ 76.64 34,488.00$       Exide S78DT $ 87.02 39,159.00$       Interstate Batteries M-78DT $ 67.87 30,541.50$       DIEHARD 34/78-4 $ 103.17 46,426.50$       

11 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent -J.C.I., BCI# - 7026, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 375, reserve cap. in mintues - 100 EA 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 75/86DT650CH $ 67.08 67.08$              ProMax SLA12-18 $ 72.1 72.10$              Interstate Batteries SP-70 $ 81.95 81.95$              DIEHARD GC70 $ 70.34 70.34$              

12 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate, BCI# - 6TMF, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 825, reserve cap. in minutes - 215 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Continental 6TL $ 206.79 2,067.90$         Deka 6TMF $ 174.4 1,744.00$         Interstate Batteries 6TL $ 141.91 1,419.10$         DIEHARD 6TL30 $ 171.51 1,715.10$         

13 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 34/78 Yellow Top, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 700, reserve cap. in minutes - 120 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion YEL34/78 $ 347.02 1,735.10$         Optima SC34DU $ 202.16 1,010.80$         Optima SC34DU $ 210.56 1,052.80$         OPTIMA D34/78-950 $ 258.29 1,291.45$         

14 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent -J.C.I., BCI# - 34/78 Red Top, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 800, reserve cap. in minutes - 100 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion RED34/78 $ 297.54 1,487.70$         Optima SC34U $ 178.16 890.80$            Optima SC34U $ 183.56 917.80$            OPTIMA 34/78-980 $ 221.39 1,106.95$         

15 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Delco, BCI# - 48AGM, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 900, reserve cap. in minutes - 160 EA 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H6-760CHAGM $ 117.47 3,524.10$         ProMax PMAGM-H648 $ 127.06 3,811.80$         Interstate Batteries MTX-48/H6 $ 157.46 4,723.80$         DIEHARD H6-AGM $ 150.74 4,522.20$         

16 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Delco, BCI# - 58, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 540, reserve cap. in minutes - 80@25A EA 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 58-550CH $ 56.55 1,696.50$         Exide S58 $ 74.37 2,231.10$         Interstate Batteries MT-58 $ 91.76 2,752.80$         DIEHARD 58-2 $ 103.17 3,095.10$         

17 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Delco, BCI# - 49/53, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 850, reserve cap. in minutes - 130@25A EA 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H8-825CH $ 114.59 3,437.70$         Exide S-H8/L5/49 $ 102.5 3,075.00$         Interstate Batteries M-49/H8 $ 80.81 2,424.30$         DIEHARD 49H8 $ 116.57 3,497.10$         

18 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent – AUX12 – CCA155@0°F (-18°C) CA12RC@1A EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 12AUX-180CH $ 85.08 1,701.60$         Powersonic PS-AUX12 $ 62.88 1,257.60$         Interstate Batteries MTX-AUX12 $ 85.46 1,709.20$         DIEHARD AUX12-1 $ 75.7 1,514.00$         

19 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 47PS-CCA: 525 at 0°F(-18°C)/ CA: 630 at 32° Reserve Capacity: 110 EA 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H5-650CHP $ 92.2 13,830.00$       Exide S-H5/L2/47 $ 76.44 11,466.00$       Interstate Batteries M-47/H5 $ 66.18 9,927.00$         DIEHARD 47H5 $ 116.57 17,485.50$       

20 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 48PS-CCA615 at 0°F(-18°C/CA750 at 32°, Reserve Capacity 110 min EA 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H6-615CH $ 82.64 41,320.00$       Exide S-H6/L3/48 $ 91.22 45,610.00$       Interstate Batteries M-48/H6 $ 67.87 33,935.00$       DIEHARD 4H6 $ 116.57 58,285.00$       

21 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 49AGM-CCA900 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA1040 at 32°, Reserve Capacity 160 min EA 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H8-900CHAGM $ 131.11 65,555.00$       ProMax PMAGM-H849 $ 151.79 75,895.00$       Interstate Batteries MTX-49/H8 $ 162.31 81,155.00$       DIEHARD H8-AGM $ 150.74 75,370.00$       

22 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 51RPS-CCA500 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA600 at 32°, Reserve Capacity (min): 85 Minute EA 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 51R425CH $ 66.44 1,993.20$         Exide S51R $ 70.78 2,123.40$         Interstate Batteries MT-51R $ 91.76 2,752.80$         DIEHARD 51R-2 $ 116.57 3,497.10$         

23 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 59PS-CCA590 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA730 at 32°, Reserve Capacity (min): 100 Minute EA 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 59-590CH $ 62.95 5,036.00$         Exide S59 $ 78.08 6,246.40$         Interstate Batteries MT-59 $ 91.76 7,340.80$         DIEHARD 59-3 $ 103.17 8,253.60$         

24 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 90PS-CCA600 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA750 at 32°, Reserve Capacity (min): 100 Minute EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion T5-650CHP $ 70.16 7,016.00$         Exide SX-T5/LB2/90 $ 91.16 9,116.00$         Interstate Batteries MTP-90/T5 $ 104.51 10,451.00$       DIEHARD 90/T5-1 $ 103.17 10,317.00$       

25 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 94R-CCA800 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA1000 at 32°, Reserve Capacity (min): 140 Minute EA 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H7-800CHP $ 83.92 25,176.00$       Exide S-H7/L4/94R $ 101.51 30,453.00$       Interstate Batteries MTP-94R/H7 $ 99.12 29,736.00$       DIEHARD 94RH7 $ 116.57 34,971.00$       

26 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  – 94R AGM-CCA 850 at 0°F(-18°C)/CA1020 at 32°, Reserve Capacity (min): 140 Minute EA 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion H7-850CHAGM $ 123.39 24,678.00$       ProMax PMAGM-H794R $ 151.14 30,228.00$       Interstate Batteries MTX-94R/H7 $ 157.46 31,492.00$       DIEHARD H7-AGM 150.74$     30,148.00$       

27 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Delco, BCI# - 4D, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 950, reserve cap. in minutes - 395@25A EA 40 East Penn BT4DP101EXCH $ 190 7,600.00 $         Continental COH4D $ 147.49 5,899.60$         Exide 4D $ 158.01 6,320.40$         Interstate Batteries M-4D $ 131.63 5,265.20$         DIEHARD 4D30 $ 133.99 5,359.60$         

28 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 2200, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 700, reserve cap. in minutes - 110 EA 100 East Penn BD31S71EXC $ 93.9 9,390.00 $         Continental COH2GC110 $ 107.97 10,797.00$       Exide GC110 $ 106.93 10,693.00$       Interstate Batteries GC2-HCL-UTL $ 89 8,900.00$         DIEHARD GC2 $ 87.09 8,709.00$         

29 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent- J.C.I, BCI# 30H, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 650, reserve cap. in minutes - 160 EA 1 East Penn BT31S61EXCH $ 81.9 81.90 $              Continental HD31A $ 74.08 74.08$              Exide 30H $ 111.85 111.85$            Interstate Batteries M-30H $ 76.96 76.96$              DIEHARD 30H-24 $ 82.4 82.40$              

30 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 31, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 800, reserve cap. in minutes - 185 EA 100 East Penn BT34P81EXCH $ 88.92 8,892.00 $         Continental COHXHD31A $ 74.22 7,422.00$         ProMax PM31S-950 $ 92.5 9,250.00$         Interstate Batteries PF-31S-7 $ 67.72 6,772.00$         DIEHARD 31S30 $ 82.4 8,240.00$         

31 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, # 31-MHD, BCI# - 31 STUD, CA - 1190, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 950, reserve cap. in minutes - 195 EA 70 East Penn BT31S91EXCH $ 78.9 5,523.00 $         Continental COHXHD31C $ 76.14 5,329.80$         ProMax PM31S-950 $ 92.5 6,475.00$         Interstate Batteries 31-MHD $ 87.28 6,109.60$         DIEHARD 31S30 $ 82.4 5,768.00$         

32 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, # 31P-MHD, BCI# - 31 POST, CA - 1190, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 950, reserve cap. in minutes - 195 EA 40 East Penn BT31P91EXCH $ 105 4,200.00 $         Continental COHXHD31A $ 74.22 2,968.80$         ProMax PM31P-950 $ 92.5 3,700.00$         Interstate Batteries 31P-MHD $ 90.24 3,609.60$         DIEHARD 31P30 $ 82.4 3,296.00$         

33 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, # 8D-MHD, BCI# - 8D, CA - 1750, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 1400, reserve cap. in minutes - 450 EA 10 East Penn BT8DP143EXCH $ 235 2,350.00 $         Continental 8D $ 128.43 1,284.30$         Exide 8DX $ 175.37 1,753.70$         Interstate Batteries 8D-MHD $ 155.36 1,553.60$         DIEHARD 8DFT $ 171.51 1,715.10$         

34 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent  - 6TL -CCA: 1,225A at 0°F (-18°C) CA/MCA: 1,550A at 32° (0°C) Reserve capacity: 240 minutes on 25amps EA 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Continental 6TL $ 206.79 12,407.40$       Deka 6TMF $ 177.9 10,674.00$       Interstate Batteries 6TL $ 141.91 8,514.60$         DIEHARD 6TL30 $ 171.51 10,290.60$       

35 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - SRM-27, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 830, reserve cap. in minutes - 240 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 27DC-850CH $ 83.22 1,664.40$         Exide 27MDC $ 110.95 2,219.00$         Interstate Batteries SRM-27 $ 76.72 1,534.40$         DIEHARD M27-1 $ 66.99 1,339.80$         

36 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 24M, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 550, reserve cap. in minutes - 140@25A EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion 24DC-685CH $ 81.38 1,627.60$         Exide 24MDC $ 101.54 2,030.80$         Interstate Batteries 24M-HD $ 67.11 1,342.20$         DIEHARD 24DC-1 $ 63.64 1,272.80$         

37 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - 78, CA - D27M Blue Top, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 800, reserve cap. in minutes - 140 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion BLUED27M $ 377.38 1,886.90$         Optima D27M $ 215.31 1,076.55$         Optima SC27FDA $ 216.86 1,084.30$         OPTIMA D27M $ 296.99 1,484.95$         

38 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - J.C.I., BCI# - U1, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 145, reserve cap. in minutes - 180 EA 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion U1-160CH $ 32.73 490.95$            Exide GT $ 35.34 530.10$            Interstate Batteries SP-18 $ 32.95 494.25$            DIEHARD U1-2 $ 30.81 462.15$            

39 Referenced Manufacturer or Equivalent - Interstate Batteries, # SP-35, BCI# - U1 CA - 375, CCA @ 0 Fah. - 300, reserve cap. in minutes - 33 EA 35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Champion U1-340CH $ 41.13 1,439.55$         Exide U1SM $ 42.79 1,497.65$         Interstate Batteries SP-35 $ 45.95 1,608.25$         DIEHARD U1-3 $ 37.51 1,312.85$         

Subtotal Total of A 250,484.15$   453,935.16$   492,883.45$   488,584.91$   587,522.69$   

B Batteries Return Credit

1 Automotive Type EA 2675 26.00$      69,550.00$       18.00$    48,150.00$       19.00$    50,825.00$       16.00$    42,800.00$       NO BID NO BID

2 Commercial Type EA 50 95.76$      4,788.00$         28.00$    1,400.00$         22.50$    1,125.00$         24.00$    1,200.00$         NO BID NO BID

3 Marine Type EA 1 NO BID NO BID 27.00$    27.00$              19.00$    19.00$              16.00$    16.00$              NO BID NO BID

4 Lawn & Garden Type EA 35 NO BID NO BID 9.00$      315.00$            10.00$    350.00$            7.00$      245.00$            NO BID NO BID

Subtotal Total of B 74,338.00$     49,892.00$      52,319.00$      44,261.00$      NO BID NO BID

Grand Total of A & B 176,146.15$   404,043.16$   440,564.45$   444,323.91$   587,522.69$   

1
Award Recommendation for Lowest Complete Bid (Primary)

2
Award Recommendation (Secondary)

3
Award Recommendation (Tertiary)

Advance Auto PartsIEH AUTO PARTS LLC
1

Interstate Battery Systems of Houston
3

Parts Authority, LLC
2

Rush Truck Centers of Texas, LP dba Rush Truck Center
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